

Exhibit C



May 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

For services rendered through January 31, 2017

***** REVISED INVOICE --- REPLACES INVOICE NO. 1726575 *****

Fees	\$	459,405.45
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	254.60
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	459,660.05



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

For services rendered through January 31, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
BUSINESS ANALYSIS				
01/18/17	Thomas R. Salley	Telephone conference with Guidepost Solutions regarding US and Cayman fund entities; review organization chart	0.90	
01/19/17	Thomas R. Salley	Review organizational chart and supporting Platinum documents	0.30	
01/20/17	Thomas R. Salley	Review PPCO Fund documents	0.40	
01/24/17	Thomas R. Salley	Review multiple Platinum organizational documents; client emails; omnibus authority proposal; client emails	2.30	
01/25/17	Thomas R. Salley	Authority issues on receivership; US v. Cayman interests; management company liability concerns, related matters; long call with D. Burstein	2.60	
		Task Total:	6.50	6,467.50
CASE ADMINISTRATION				
12/27/16	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	(Platinum) Read SEC complaint; call with B. Schwartz, C. Lindstrom, M. Dortch, D. Burstein, and R. Rittereiser regarding Houston trustee issues; telephone call with Alan Levine regarding same.	0.90	
12/28/16	Alan Levine	New Matter (Platinum Partners) - Preparing for SEC and for Black Elk Trustee, including calls with Receiver (1.0), with SEC (1.0), with Scully lawyers (.5) , with Zach Weiner (1.0); reading existing orders in NY, Texas and cases provided by SEC (2.5)	6.00	
12/28/16	Abigail Belknap Seidner	(Platinum) Case Administration: Correspondence with A. Levine re Black Elk temporary restraining order	0.50	
12/28/16	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	(Platinum) Telephone call with A. Levine and C. Lindstrom regarding Houston trustee background and status (1.0); telephone call with A. Levine regarding same and to do (.3);	2.10	



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		telephone call with A. Levine and B. Schwartz regarding A. Levine's telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding Houston trustee (.4); telephone call and Z. Weiner regarding factual background (.4).	
12/29/16	Alan Levine	New Matter (Platinum Partners) - Calls with client gathering facts for SEC meeting - call with Harvey Werblowsky (1.0); call with Receiver (.5); call with SEC (.3); call with Scully lawyer (.2)	2.00
12/29/16	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	(Platinum) Review emails and begin to organize factual information into chronology and develop players list (3.6); telephone call with A. Levine and H. Werblowsky regarding [REDACTED] issues (.7); telephone call with A. Levine and N. Jacobson and short follow-up telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding Houston trustee (.4); telephone call with B. Schwartz, L. Gottlieb, N. White, C. Lindstrom, M. Dortch, R. Rittreiser, D. Burstein regarding Houston trustee issues, Black Hawk and related issues (.5); telephone calls with L. Gottlieb regarding Houston trustee issues and to do (.5); telephone call with A. Levine and Z. Weiner regarding [REDACTED] settlement (.3); telephone calls with A. Levine regarding status and to do (.3); emails regarding meeting with trustee (.1).	6.40
12/29/16	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Celia	0.30
12/29/16	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review documents re: background of Platinum receivership	1.50
12/29/16	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Schwartz, Levine, Barenholtz, Burstein regarding developments in Platinum	0.80
12/30/16	Alan Levine	New Matter (Platinum Partners) - Calls with client gathering facts for SEC meeting	2.00
12/30/16	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Review and analyze SEC case filings (3.7)	3.70
12/30/16	Alan Levine	New Matter re: Platinum: Gathering facts with counsel in Black Elk bankruptcy; reading legal papers (1.0); evaluating TRO in Texas and order in EDNY (1.0); calls with Bart Schwartz	3.00



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		(.6), Zach Weiner (.4)	
12/30/16	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	(Platinum) Prepare for SEC meeting by reviewing emails and drafting bullet point outline and chronology (4.9); telephone call with A. Levine and Z. Weiner regarding PPCO transactions (1.0); telephone call with D. Steinberg regarding PPCO transactions (.7); telephone call and emails with A. Levine and L. Gottlieb regarding status and to do (.4); emails with C. Lindstrom, B. Schwartz and members of Platinum and Guidepost teams regarding receivership matters (.5); review and comment on affidavit per receivership order and emails re same (.3); emails with SEC and A. Seidner regarding notice of appearance (.1).	7.90
12/30/16	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review documents and call and emails with L Reinhardt regarding issues relating to Black Elk.	1.80
12/31/16	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	(Platinum) Continue to review emails and develop chronology and bullet point agenda for SEC meeting.	3.80
12/31/16	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review agenda, etc from Celia and review additional documents	1.10
01/01/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Read TRO application (1.4); continue to develop chronology and bullet point agenda for SEC meeting (.5); telephone call with A. Levine and L. Gottlieb regarding SEC meeting and Black Elk bankruptcy (.8), finalize draft agenda for SEC meeting and email to B Schwartz (.8)	3.50
01/01/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Review and analyze SEC case filings (1.2); review Black Elk bankruptcy case filings (1.0)	2.20
01/02/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Bart, Levine et al. regarding meeting with the SEC.	0.70
01/02/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review revised agenda from Celia	0.40
01/02/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails with Reichardt re issues re Houston bankruptcy	0.30
01/02/17	Alan Levine	Call with Receiver and counsel to prep for SEC	2.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		meeting (1.2); review and revise agenda for delivery to SEC (1.3)	
01/02/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review receiver order and revise SEC document into document for SEC (1.8); telephone call with A. Levine regarding SEC meeting and strategy (.2); call with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein; R. Rittereiser, A. Levine and M. Klett regarding SEC meeting and further revisions to SEC meeting document (1.8); emails regarding same (.2).	4.00
01/03/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review revised agenda and related emails	0.30
01/03/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Meeting at the SEC with Jacobson, Levine, Schwartz, Rittereiser, et al. (1.2) and preparation for same (0.8)	2.00
01/03/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Look at North Star documents related to preliminary injunction	0.20
01/03/17	Alan Levine	Meeting at SEC with Receiver (1.2); prep for meeting and conference with Receiver after meeting to prepare for Court application (3.0); call with Platinum's Black Elk counsel (0.3)	4.50
01/03/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Meeting with A. Levine regarding status, telephone call with A. Levine & J. Brown and emails with B. Schwartz regarding same (.3); final revisions to document for SEC meeting and emails regarding same (1.4); meeting with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, M. Klett, R. Rittereiser, A. Levine, L. Gottlieb and SEC staff regarding Black Elk TRO problem and follow-up meeting with guidepost team regarding same and to do (travel time omitted) (3.0).	4.70
01/03/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Finalize and file notices of appearance (1.1); confer with A. Levine and C. Barenholtz re SEC meeting (0.3); review temporary restraining order (1.0); review agenda for SEC meeting (0.5)	2.90
01/04/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re North Star	0.20
01/04/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Levine, Bart, Smyser et al	0.50
01/04/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review and comment on Schwartz declaration	0.80



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		and related issues	
01/04/17	Alan Levine	Call with Black Elk Trustee lawyer (0.5); meeting with Receiver about Beechwood (1.0); call with Robert Rittereiser about Beechwood (0.3); call with Scully firm about insurance premium and correspondence with Smyser (0.8)	2.60
01/04/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails from members of Guidepost re declaration and process	0.30
01/04/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Draft B. Schwartz declaration in support of SEC application to modify order and emails with A. Seidner, A. Levine, L. Gottlieb and D. Burstein regarding same and to do (7.2); telephone call with R. Rittereiser and A. Levine regarding Beechwood (.3); meeting with A. Levine and B. Schwartz regarding status and to prepare for call with trustee (1.0); telephone call with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, L. Gottlieb, C. Lindstrom, C. Smyser, M. Okin, D. Burstein, and others and lawyers for trustees regarding Black Elk adversary proceeding and TRO and follow-up call with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, L. Gottlieb, D. Burstein, M. Dortch, and C. Lindstrom (.6); meeting with A. Seidner regarding status and to do (.1); emails regarding approval of life insurance premium (.2).	9.40
01/04/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re TRO declaration (0.2); revise Receiver declaration and exhibits for EDNY TRO (4.6)	4.60
01/05/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review revised Schwartz declaration and confer with Barenholtz	0.50
01/05/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Revise B. Schwartz declaration and numerous telephone calls, meetings and/or emails regarding same and related matters with N. Jacobson, D. Burstein, A. Levine, C. Lindstrom, L. Gottlieb, A. Seidner, and B. Schwartz (5.9); telephone calls with R. Rittereiser and C. Lindstrom regarding Arabella (.3); telephone calls and emails with D. Burstein and A. Seidner regarding entities not	8.60



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		in receivership or liquidation (.4); read indictment (.5); telephone call with D. Burstein and N. Jacobson regarding order modifications, retention of Cooley and Guidepost, and related matters and emails with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, A. Seidner and D. Burstein regarding same and to do (1.5).	
01/05/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Finalize and file order to show cause, receiver declaration and exhibits (4.4)	4.40
01/06/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review revised declaration	0.30
01/06/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call with J. Newville regarding [REDACTED] and emails regarding same with B. Schwartz and R. Rittereiser (.1); emails with C. Lindstrom regarding [REDACTED] (.1); revise B. Schwartz declaration and related matters and numerous telephone calls and/or emails regarding same with L. Gottlieb, C. Lindstrom, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, R. Rittereiser, A. Seidner, M. Klett, N. Jacobson (7.0); review draft Order to Show Cause and legal argument section of brief and emails regarding same with N. Jacobson and Receiver team (.8).	8.00
01/06/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Confer with R. Morales re EDNY filings (0.2); research Platinum payroll permissions (1.8); confer with D. Steinberg re payroll issues (0.1); revise Receiver declaration and exhibits for TRO (5.1); entities research (1.2)	8.40
01/07/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review email from SEC with comments to B. Schwartz declaration (.3); numerous emails (and telephone call with D. Burstein) with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, A. Levine, and A. Seidner regarding same and to do (2.0).	2.30
01/07/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Revise Receiver declaration and exhibits for TRO (3.4); review draft memorandum of law (0.4)	3.80
01/08/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re North Star and proposed Schwartz declaration	0.60



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
 TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
01/08/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review revised declaration	0.30
01/08/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Numerous emails and/or telephone calls with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, A. Seidner, D. Steinberg, S. Salfati, H. Werblowsky, R. Rittereiser, C. Lindstrom, N. Jacobson, and L. Gottlieb regarding revisions to declaration per SEC comments and related matters (1.5); review and revise declaration (4.3); review and comment on supporting papers (.5).	6.30
01/08/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Revise Receiver declaration and exhibits for TRO (10.4)	10.40
01/09/17	Alan Levine	Review of SEC/Receiver final papers and making suggestions to them	1.50
01/09/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review latest emails on proposed order and business issues	0.40
01/09/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with B. Schwartz, A. Seidner and N. Jacobson regarding declaration (.1); preparation for TRO application (.3); meeting with N. Jacobson to review and finalize papers and prepare for TRO application (travel time omitted) (2.0); go to court with N. Jacobson and K. McGrath to submit TRO papers (travel time omitted) (2.5); email B. Schwartz, R. Rittereiser, D. Burstein, M. Klett, C. Lindstrom, A. Seidner, L. Gottlieb and A. Levine regarding status and telephone call with A. Levine regarding same (.3)	5.20
01/09/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Finalize and file order to show cause, receiver declaration and exhibits (4.6)	4.60
01/09/17	Ruben D. Morales	Docket work - Updating Litroll folder with court flings,PDF work.	2.00
01/10/17	Alan Levine	Call with Celia Barenholtz about EDNY application and next steps	0.20
01/10/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails and telephone calls with A. Levine, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, and N. Jacobson regarding status of TRO application and next steps (1.5); draft letter to court, telephone calls and/or emails regarding same with N. Jacobson, A. Levine, B. Schwartz, D.	5.20



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Burstein, and A. Seidner (1.1); review C. Smyser letter regarding TRO motion and telephone call with N. Jacobson, emails with A. Levine, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, C. Lindstrom, L. Gottlieb, R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, and A. Seidner regarding same (.5); telephone calls with D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, and A. Seidner regarding same, entities meeting, litigations and lift stay applications (.5); telephone call with A. Levine and emails with C. Lindstrom and L. Gottlieb regarding Black Elk litigation issues (.8); draft Chicago lift stay (.8).	
01/10/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Review C. Smyser TRO objections (0.4); revise draft motion to lift Chicago stay (1.8); research entities' receivership potential (4.1).	6.30
01/11/17	Alan Levine	Call with all counsel for Receiver and Receiver to discuss next steps (1.3); call with Craig Smyser and with Celia Barenholtz re payments (0.7); call with Platinum and Guidepost on entities (1.2); call with Receiver to discuss Craig Smyser reaction to EDNY-TRO application (0.5); meeting with Receiver and Celia Barenholtz to discuss next step with Trustee (1.2)	4.90
01/11/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review emails re North Star and comment	0.50
01/11/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review EDNY order regarding TRO and telephone calls/emails regarding same and to do with N. Jacobson, A. Levine, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, L. Gottlieb, C. Lindstrom, and M. Dortch (2.0); telephone call with A. Levine and C. Smyser and telephone calls/emails regarding same with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, C. Lindstrom, M. Dortch, L. Gottlieb, A. Seidner and N. Jacobson (1.5); emails regarding PI hearing (.1); telephone call with Dechert, Guidepost, A. Seidner, and A. Levine regarding entities issues, follow-up meeting with A. Seidner and telephone call with A. Levine regarding same (1.1); review Black Elk answer and telephone call with M. Dortch	5.60



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		regarding same and related matters (.6); work on Chicago lift stay application and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same (.3).	
01/11/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Review organizational documents to determine entities' receivership potential (6.5); review Black Elk Answer (0.3); call with D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, L. Gottlieb, C. Barenholtz, and C. Lindstrom re EDNY order to show cause (0.8); confer with C. Barenholtz re entities issues (0.6) call with C. Barenholtz, A. Levine and Guidepost re entities' receivership potential (0.7); finalize motion to lift Chicago litigation stay (1.7)	10.60
01/11/17	Robert B. Winning	Meeting with Gottlieb re: Northstar Chapter 11 issue and follow-up	0.70
01/12/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review emails re North Star and call with Celia Barenholtz and Don Burstein	0.70
01/12/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone calls with D. Burstein, L. Gottlieb and A. Levine regarding potential Northstar DIP financing and meeting with L. Gottlieb regarding same (.8); start revising Cooley and Guidepost retention applications (.5); telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding negotiations with C. Smyser regarding Texas cases and telephone calls with A. Levine and D. Burstein regarding same (.8); numerous emails and telephone calls with A. Levine, T. Salley, A. Seidner, D. Burstein, and B. Schwartz regarding to dos and upcoming meetings (.8); telephone calls with M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, A. Levine, and A. Seidner regarding Texas PI hearing to do and brief (.8).	3.70
01/12/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Coordinate filing of motion to lift litigation stay (0.2); create chronology (2.1); correspondence with D. Pohlman re entities issues (0.8); correspondence re Texas deposition prep (0.3); confer with C. Barenholtz re filing issues (0.2); confer with C. Barenholtz and D. Pohlman re Texas preliminary injunction brief	7.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		(0.2); prepare Texas preliminary injunction brief (3.7)	
01/12/17	Robert B. Winning	Meeting with Gottlieb re: Northstar bankruptcy case and follow-up	0.40
01/13/17	Alan Levine	Call with SEC re strategy for Black Elk Trustee (1.0); review ██████████ transaction (0.5); call with SEC about Black Elk Trustee (0.8); call with SEC and Texas counsel on proposal for Black Elk Trustee (0.7); call with Bart Schwartz re D&O issues (0.2)	3.20
01/13/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Meeting at Guidepost re North Star and advise Celia Barenholtz on results	1.40
01/13/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with A. Grace, D. Sallah, J. Velona, K. McGrath et al. and Celia Barenholtz regarding Beechwood	0.80
01/13/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review Black Elk complaint to calculate amount of claim of Trustee	0.80
01/13/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Abigail re ██████████ claim	0.10
01/13/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Work on retention issues, including telephone call with N. Jacobson, retention applications for Guidepost and Cooley, meetings with D. Pohlman regarding same and ordinary course attorney applications, emails with D. Burstein regarding retention issues (2.6); administrative matters (.5); telephone calls and emails with A. Seidner, M. Dortch, and C. Lindstrom regarding PI hearing issues (.9); telephone call with B. Schwartz, M. Dortch and C. Lindstrom regarding B. Schwartz deposition preparation in connection with Texas PI (1.0); preparation for and calls regarding potential resolution of Black Elk case with A. Levine, N. Jacobson, C. Lindstrom, M. Dortch, L. Gottlieb, A. Seidner, and B. Schwartz, and emails regarding same (3.5); meeting with L. Gottlieb regarding Northstar DIP financing and related matters (.2); prepare for and telephone call with Bermuda regulators, SEC, K. Byrne, R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, W. Gluck, M. Wright, C. Kennedy, A. Grace, D. Sallah, J. Velona, and	9.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		K. McGrath regarding Agara (.8).	
01/13/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Draft and file declaration in support of motion to lift litigation stay (1.1); correspondence re deposition prep (0.2); confer with C. Barenholtz re entities and preliminary injunction brief (0.2); review PPBE entity structure (0.2); confer with R. Winning re constructive trust research (0.2); call re Texas trustee strategy (1.0); prepare Texas preliminary injunction brief (0.9)	3.80
01/15/17	Alan Levine	Settlement call with Black Elk Trustee, SEC and us	1.50
01/15/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Preparation for call with A. Levine and N. Jacobson (.1); call with A. Levine, N. Jacobson, J. Waggoner, and C. Smyser regarding possible resolution of Black Elk case (1.2); follow-up call with A. Levine and N. Jacobson (.1); emails regarding letter to court briefing schedule (.1).	1.50
01/16/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Legal research regarding interplay of orders appointing receivers and the public interest prong of the preliminary injunction test (1.4); legal research regarding cases where preliminary injunctions were vacated as there was no showing of irreparable harm, focusing on situations where there was no irreparable harm because the party would be able to recover at a later date (1.7); summarized legal research findings and corresponded with A. Seidner regarding the same (0.5).	3.60
01/16/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with A. Levine, B. Schwartz, R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, and D. Pohlman regarding scheduling, status and to dos.	0.50
01/16/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Prepare Texas preliminary injunction brief (2.3)	2.30
01/17/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Legal research regarding preliminary injunctions in support of or against receiverships, focusing on situations where courts recognized the receiver's ability to protect all investor assets in relation to the	2.80



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		irreparable harm prong of the preliminary injunction test. (2.8)	
01/17/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Rittenheiser and Celia Barenholtz re Beechwood	0.90
01/17/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Confer with Winning re claim amount	0.50
01/17/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review and revise Cooley and Guidepost applications and meeting with D. Pohlman regarding same (1.4); prepare for and meeting with M. Klett, R. Rittereiser and A. Seidner regarding Beechwood/Agera transaction and follow-up call with A. Levine and A. Seidner regarding same (3.0); telephone call regarding same with M. Klett, R. Rittereiser, A. Seidner, L. Gottlieb, and W. Gluck (1.4); several follow-up telephone calls regarding same with R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, A. Seidner and L. Gottlieb (1.0); emails and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding Platinum entities not in receivership or liquidation and miscellaneous to do items (.5); telephone call with L. Gottlieb regarding Black Elk settlement issues and emails with L. Gottlieb, A. Levine, M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, and N. Jacobson regarding same and to do (.6).	7.90
01/17/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Prepare for meeting re Agera (0.2); correspondence re preliminary injunction research (0.3); meeting with R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, and C. Barenholtz re Agera and Beechwood (2.3); call with PPVA counsel re Agera (1.4); call with R. Rittereiser, C. Barenholtz, and M. Klett re Agera claims (0.2); call with C. Barenholtz and A. Levine re Agera (0.2); call with L. Gottlieb re fraudulent conveyance (0.1); draft memorandum re Agera situation (7.5)	12.20
01/17/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of Black Elk constructive trust arguments and revision to Reichardt memorandum re: same	2.10
01/18/17	Alan Levine	Call with Black Elk Trustee and SEC (0.7); call with co-counsel and SEC and prep for	1.70



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		settlement call (1.0)	
01/18/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review complaint and confer with Barenholtz	2.00
01/18/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Hoover, Barenholtz and Levine re issues with settlement proposal	1.50
01/18/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review analysis of North Star deal	0.40
01/18/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Attention to [REDACTED] matters including preparation for and telephone call with B. Schwartz regarding status (.8); telephone calls with D. Burstein regarding same (.3); telephone call with K. Byrnes regarding same (.3); emails regarding same (.3); evaluate settlement offer for Black Elk case, including preparation for and meeting with L. Gottlieb regarding complaint (1.3); telephone call with B. Schwartz regarding offer parameters (.1); prepare for call regarding settlement with Texas counsel (1.0); telephone call with M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, L. Gottlieb, and A. Levine regarding complaint and terms of settlement offer (1.3); telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding terms of offer (.4); telephone call with C. Smyser, J. Waggoner, M. Okin, J. Potts, A. Levine, and N. Jacobson regarding offer (.5); follow-up telephone calls and/or emails regarding same with B. Schwartz, N. Jacobson, A. Levine, M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, A. Seidner and L. Gottlieb (1.0); attention to retention applications including review and revise Cooley, Guidepost and Houlihan Lokey applications, meetings with D. Pohlman regarding same, emails with N. Jacobson regarding Cooley application, telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding Guidepost application, meeting with D. Pohlman and A. Seidner regarding filing and EDNY procedures (1.6); telephone calls and emails with D. Burstein regarding entities issues, [REDACTED] and other to dos (.4); emails regarding Houston hearing (.1); telephone calls with B. Schwartz and A. Levine regarding insurance matters and emails with A. Mooney	9.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		regarding same (.1).	
01/18/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Case Administration: Confer with C. Barenholtz re upcoming filings (0.2); draft Texas preliminary injunction brief (4.6)	4.80
01/18/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of Black Elk bankruptcy case and litigation against Platinum	1.40
01/19/17	Ann M. Mooney	Telephone conversation with A. Collura re D&O insurance issues; meet with A. Levine re same	0.60
01/19/17	Alan Levine	Review settlement email to Black Elk Trustee and conference with Celia Barenholtz (0.8); review Black Elk Trustee affidavit and brief in opposition to our motion and prep of components of answering papers (1.5)	2.30
01/19/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Meeting with Celia, B. Schwartz and Bob R.	3.50
01/19/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails regarding Black Elk settlement offer, draft offer email and emails and/or telephone calls regarding same with N. Jacobson, A. Levine, D. Burstein, and L. Gottlieb (1.8); preparation for Black Elk PI hearing, including telephone call with N. Jacobson (.1), meetings with A. Seidner (.6), emails with N. Jacobson and D. Burstein (.1), administrative matters (.2); review draft DOJ order and emails with N. Jacobson and A. Levine regarding same (.1); review and revise retention applications or revised retention applications for Guidepost, Trinet and Houlihan Lokey, and meetings with D. Pohlman regarding same and related matters (1.8); review and revise Houlihan Lokey NDA (.3); Northstar [REDACTED] meeting with L. Gottlieb, R Winning, R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, T. Daley (in part), Z. Weiner (in part), B. Schwartz and D. Burstein and brief follow-up meeting with L. Gottlieb (3.8); telephone call with N. Jacobson, K. Byrne, and W. Gluck regarding [REDACTED] (.4); telephone calls with W. Gluck regarding same (1.0); telephone calls and emails with B. Schwartz, R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, and D. Burstein regarding	11.00



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		same and related matters (.8).	
01/19/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re injunction briefs and deposition prep (0.4); confer with D. Pohlman re research for briefs (0.6); correspondence re deposition (0.5); review Trustee opposition papers (1.2); prepare for B. Schwartz deposition (2.3); correspondence and analysis re Black Elk transfer tracing (1.2); draft preliminary injunction brief (3.8)	10.00
01/19/17	Ruben D. Morales	Docket work - Updating Litroll folder with court filings, PDF work (.5); Printing cases, creating index, binder work (1).	1.50
01/19/17	Robert B. Winning	Prepare for and attend meeting re: Northstar investment and related correspondence	3.20
01/20/17	Alan Levine	Review █████ transaction in emails and documents	1.30
01/20/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Meeting with Bart and Celia re various matters	0.60
01/20/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Read papers submitted by Black Elk trustee in opposition to EDNY emergency motion (.7); prepare for B. Schwartz deposition with A. Seidner and C. Lindstrom, attend deposition and follow-up meetings with B. Schwartz and C. Lindstrom (5.5); meeting with A. Seidner regarding same and to dos (.8); meeting with B. Schwartz and L. Gottlieb regarding Northstar (.5); emails regarding Beechwood issues (.4); emails and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding B. Schwartz deposition, █████ security, Small, Guidepost and Cooley applications and Chicago lift stay (.5); prepare for Texas PI hearing (.6).	9.00
01/20/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re injunction briefs and deposition (1.2); meet with B. Schwartz, C. Barenholtz, and C. Lindstrom re deposition prep (1.3); confer with H. Gonzalez re filing issues (0.1); confer with courtroom deputy re filing issues (0.1); correspondence re ECF issues (0.1); review █████ letter (0.1); confer with N. Jacobson re briefs (0.1); correspondence and analysis re Black Elk	13.80



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		transfer tracing (2.0); confer with Z. Weiner re tracing (0.1); confer with C. Lindstrom re tracing (0.1); draft preliminary injunction brief (8.6)	
01/20/17	Robert B. Winning	Meeting with Gottlieb re: Northstar DIP issues and follow-up	0.90
01/21/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Reviewed cases cited by the Trustee in its briefing in support of entry of a preliminary injunction, focusing on areas that could be distinguished and researching potential counterpoints to the arguments raised (3.5); created summary of legal research findings related to distinguishing the Trustee's cited cases (0.5).	4.00
01/21/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with B. Schwartz and D. Burstein regarding Northstar, expenses, and Small (.1); work on brief in opposition to Texas PI motion, including reading cases, telephone calls with A. Seidner, emails with C. Lindstrom, M. Dortch, N. Jacobson, and revise and draft portions of fact section of brief (8.0).	8.10
01/21/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Draft preliminary injunction brief (14.3); confer with C. Barenholtz re preliminary injunction brief (0.7); confer with R. Winning re bankruptcy law (0.4); confer with D. Pohlman re research for preliminary injunction brief (0.1)	15.50
01/22/17	Alan Levine	Review proposed Black Elk brief	0.50
01/22/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Draft letters to Small counsel and court regarding litigation stay and emails regarding same with N. Jacobson and D. Burstein (.7); emails regarding funding issues (.1); telephone call with A. Levine regarding Beechwood and PPVA issues (1.1); work on Black Elk preliminary injunction brief including drafting, revising, reading cases and telephone calls and emails with A. Seidner (9.9).	11.80
01/22/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Draft preliminary injunction brief (12.9); review patent litigation investment background for preliminary injunction prep (1.0); confer with C. Barenholtz re preliminary injunction brief (0.1)	14.00



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
01/23/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revised sections of Texas preliminary injunction briefing related to cases cited by the Trustee in support of the preliminary injunction (1.4); revised declaration of Bart. M. Schwartz in further support of temporary restraining order based on comments from C. Barenholtz (1.8); substantively cite checked and reply temporary restraining order briefing to ensure accuracy of cases and conformance with other filings (1.7); reviewed transcript of deposition of Bart M. Schwartz related to the Texas adversary proceeding to create list of areas where the Receiver promised he would provide the Trustee more information (1.8).	6.70
01/23/17	Alan Levine	Review of Bart Schwartz declaration for SD Texas - Black Elk (0.8); review Reply Brief for SD Texas - Black Elk (0.7); review Bart Schwartz deposition from SD Texas - Black Elk (1.5)	3.00
01/23/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review objection to TRO and PI	0.50
01/23/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review emails re settlement issues with Trustee and call with Celia B.	0.50
01/23/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Finalize Small letters and telephone calls and/or emails regarding same with D. Burstein, N. Jacobson and Small counsel (.3); emails regarding Black Elk email server (.1); revise Black Elk PI brief and emails and/or telephone calls regarding same with A. Seidner, A. Levine, L. Gottlieb, M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, and N. Jacobson (5.8); emails regarding funding requests (.4); review, edit and comment on SEC draft brief and meeting and telephone calls with A. Seidner regarding same (1.5); draft B. Schwartz reply declaration and emails regarding same (2.0); attention to Cooley and Guidepost retention orders (.3); telephone call with M. Klett regarding investors and debt numbers (.2); telephone calls, emails and meetings with A. Levine regarding [REDACTED] (.3).	10.90



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
01/23/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Draft Texas preliminary injunction brief (7.0); revise EDNY TRO reply brief (4.3); confer with C. Barenholtz re briefs and supporting materials (0.9); correspondence with D. Pohlman re briefs and supporting materials (0.7); call courtroom deputy (0.1); correspondence re facts for preliminary injunction brief (0.5); confer with R. Winning re Texas brief (0.9); confer with M. Klett re brief factual background (0.1); revise declaration for EDNY reply brief (0.8); research re PPLO entities (0.5)	15.80
01/23/17	Robert B. Winning	Review and revise opposition to PI in Black Elk adversary proceeding and call with Seidner re: same	1.70
01/24/17	Ann M. Mooney	Conference call with A. Collura, S. Horowitz and H. Werblowsky re background and status of D&O insurance issues; continue review of background documents, including SEC complaint	1.50
01/24/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Meet with C. Barenholtz and A. Seidner to discuss filings (0.2); discuss distribution of tasks, outline remaining work product to be completed with A. Seidner (0.2); review and revise memorandum of law in support of temporary restraining order to be filed in EDNY, implementing edits from the SEC (0.5); compiled list of potential additions to exhibit list to be filed in conjunction with brief in opposition to issuance of a preliminary injunction for the S.D. Tex. action (0.7); further reviewed and revised joint EDNY filing (0.2); performed substantive cite check and made appropriate revisions to S.D. Tex. briefing (1.2); discussed letter to Craig Smyser following up on questions from Deposition of Bart M. Schwartz with C. Barenholtz (0.2); prepared letter to Craig Smyser providing further detail in response to some areas of questioning outlined in deposition of Bart M. Schwartz (1.5); discussed entity issues with A. Seidner (0.2); call with C. Barenholtz and	6.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Guidepost professionals regarding ownership of the email server (0.4); call with C. Lindstrom discussing understanding of email issues (0.2); further revised letter to Craig Smyser (1.0).	
01/24/17	Alan Levine	Review settlement counter proposal with client; review final version affidavit and brief	1.00
01/24/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone calls with A. Levine regarding PPVA and miscellaneous other issues (.2); final revisions to EDNY brief, Black Elk PI brief, B. Schwartz reply declaration, and telephone calls, meetings and/or emails regarding same with N. Jacobson, A. Seidner, D. Pohlman, C. Lindstrom, A. Levine, D. Burstein, and B. Schwartz regarding same (4.6); review and revise C. Lindstrom declaration (.2); email to C. Smyser regarding funding and emails with B. Schwartz, M. Dortch, and D. Burstein regarding same (.1); draft emails to C. Smyser regarding withdrawal of PI hearing, and numerous emails with A. Seidner, L. Gottlieb, A. Levine, C. Lindstrom, M. Dortch, B. Schwartz, and D. Burstein regarding same (1.4); telephone call with D. Pohlman regarding miscellaneous issues (.1); telephone call and meeting with R. Winning regarding Black Elk settlement proposal allowed claim vs. judgment issue (.6); emails and telephone calls with A. Seidner, C. Lindstrom, and A. Levine regarding exhibit list and witness lists in connection with Black Elk PI hearing (.3); review Platinum email policy and telephone calls with D. Pohlman, D. Burstein, P. Poteat, C. Lindstrom, and H. Werblowsky regarding email server issues, email B. Schwartz regarding same (.7); meetings with D. Pohlman regarding B. Schwartz deposition follow-up letter (.2).	8.40
01/24/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Finalize and file EDNY brief and supporting materials (5.6); finalize and file Texas brief and supporting materials (2.2); research re PPLO (0.6); confer with C. Barenholtz and D.	9.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Pohlman re filings (0.7); confer with H. Gonzalez re EDNY filings (0.4)	
01/24/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of Black Elk settlement issue and meeting with Barenholtz re: same	2.20
01/25/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revised letter to Craig Smyser following up on areas of questioning from the deposition of Bart M. Schwartz, focusing on edits to section regarding litigation finance arrangements (0.8); revised section of letter to Smyser regarding D&O policies (0.3).	1.10
01/25/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails and meetings with A. Seidner and D. Pohlman regarding to dos (.3); voice mail and email with C. Smyser regarding PI hearing withdrawal, several emails with M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, A. Seidner, A. Levine, L. Gottlieb, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein and N. Jacobson regarding same, telephone call with A. Levine regarding same (1.2); telephone call and emails with N. Jacobson regarding next steps regarding Black Elk case (.3); review and revise draft EDNY letter to Judge Irizarry regarding mootness issues and emails with A. Seidner regarding same (.4); draft email to C. Smyser regarding outlining proposed settlement and email with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, A. Seidner, A. Levine, and L. Gottlieb regarding same (.8); read EDNY docket entries (.1); emails regarding review of proposed order withdrawing Black Elk PI (.3); telephone call with R. Winning regarding judgment vs. allowed claim issue (.2); telephone call with T. Salley and A. Seidner regarding entities issues (.3); review and revise letter to C. Smyser regarding deposition issues and telephone calls with A. Seidner regarding same (.6); prepare for and telephone call with C. Smyser et al and N. Jacobson, follow-up telephone call with N. Jacobson and follow-up emails with B. Schwartz and A. Levine regarding settlement of Black Elk adversary proceeding (1.4); prepare for and attend conference call with	9.60



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Black Elk bankruptcy court regarding PI withdrawal (.5); telephone call with T. Salley, D. Burstein, and A. Seidner regarding entities not in receivership or liquidation and related issues (1.4); telephone call with A. Seidner and N. Jacobson regarding SEC response to settlement offer (.1); status call with B. Schwartz and D. Burstein (.4); emails with L. Gottlieb, R. Winning, and A. Seidner regarding Black Elk settlement subordination issues and emails regarding same with N. Jacobson (.5); telephone call with N. Jacobson, D. Burstein, and A. Seidner regarding entities not in receivership or liquidation (.8).	
01/25/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Correspondence re Texas settlement (0.2); draft letter to EDNY re Texas developments (3.2); review ██████████ documents (0.5); research and summarize entity issues (4.2); confer with C. Barenholtz re entities issues (0.2); confer with C. Barenholtz and T. Salley re entities issues (0.2); call with C. Barenholtz, D. Burstein, and T. Salley re entities issues (1.4); call with C. Barenholtz, L. Gottlieb, and R. Winning re bankruptcy issues (0.4); call with C. Barenholtz, B. Schwartz, and Guidepost team re entities and Texas issues (0.4); call with C. Barenholtz and N. Jacobson re entities and Texas issues (0.1); telephonic conference with Texas bankruptcy court (0.5); review draft letter to Trustee re deposition follow-up issues (0.5)	11.80
01/25/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of property of estate issue raised in Black Elk adversary proceeding and call with Barenholz re: same	1.40
01/25/17	Robert B. Winning	Research re: subordination of Receivership claims in Black Elk bankruptcy and call with Barenholtz and Gottlieb re: same	0.80
01/26/17	Alan Levine	Call with Celia Barenholtz; review settlement proposal	0.50
01/26/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Correspondence re Texas settlement (0.3); coordinate document security protocols (0.2);	4.80



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		finalize and file letter to EDNY re Texas developments (0.8); research and summarize jurisdictional issues (2.4); confer with N. Jacobson re jurisdictional issues (0.1); confer with D. Burstein re jurisdictional and confidentiality issues (0.2); confer with court re docket entries (0.1); review codefendant letters (0.2); review correspondence re entities issues (0.3)	
01/26/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Read DOJ stay motion and email with A. Seidner regarding same (.1); revise Cooley and Guidepost retention applications, meeting with D. Pohlman regarding to do, telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same (1.1); telephone calls with L. Gottlieb regarding Black Elk settlement claims issue and email regarding revised language (.5); emails and/or telephone calls with N. Jacobson, A. Levine, L. Gottlieb, M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, A. Seidner, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, and C. Smyser regarding settlement proposal and further revisions to draft term sheet (2.0); emails with D. Burstein and A. Seidner regarding notice requirement (.1); draft access request and emails with N. Jacobson regarding same (.1); meeting with A. Seidner and email with D. Burstein regarding safeguarding SEC documents (.1); meeting and emails with A. Levine regarding status (.2); review and analyze emails from Platinum staff regarding entities issue (.5); letter to C. Smyser regarding deposition issues and emails with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, M. Dortch, and C. Lindstrom regarding same (.1); review emails from B. Schwartz regarding status of various matters (.5); review draft applications for ordinary course attorneys(.3); telephone call with D. Burstein regarding other attorney fees and retention applications and Houlihan Lokey (.1).	5.70
01/27/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Bart	0.30
01/27/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re Northstar	0.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
01/27/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Review correspondence re Texas settlement (0.3); confer with N. Jacobson re letter to EDNY re Texas developments (0.1); coordinate filing replacement declaration (0.3); correspondence re entities issues (0.2); confer with C. Barenholtz re settlement issues (0.1)	1.00
01/27/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Meeting with D. Pohlman regarding litigations spreadsheet and voicemail with D. Burstein regarding same (.1); review revised Cooley and Guidepost applications, telephone calls and emails with N. Jacobson regarding same and meetings with D. Pohlman regarding same (.4); emails with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, and D. Burstein regarding status and to dos (.5); attention to Black Elk including reviewing and circulating trustee's settlement proposal and email regarding interest (.1), telephone calls regarding same with N. Jacobson (.2), telephone call with C. Smyser, J. Waggoner, and N. Jacobson regarding same (.5), revise term sheet, telephone calls with N. Jacobson regarding same, emails with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, L. Gottlieb, A. Levine, C. Lindstrom, M. Dortch, and trustees' counsel regarding same (1.3), review counter proposal, telephone call with C. Smyser regarding same and related issues and emails regarding same with N. Jacobson, B. Schwartz, M. Dortch, L. Gottlieb and A. Seidner (.5), telephone conference with A. Seidner regarding drafting letter to court and revised order based on settlement with Black Elk trustee (.1); emails and telephone calls with A. Seidner and A. Levine regarding consents to Cooley, Guidepost and Houlihan Lokey applications (.1); telephone call with L. Gottlieb and email with D. Burstein, A. Seidner, and L. Gottlieb regarding Black Elk claim review (.1); telephone call with N. Jacobson and L. Gottlieb regarding Northstar, follow-up meeting with L. Gottlieb regarding same, telephone call with L. Gottlieb and B. Schwartz regarding	4.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		same and email with B. Schwartz regarding same (.6).	
01/27/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of Black Elk claims reconciliation process in bankruptcy proceeding	0.70
01/27/17	Robert B. Winning	Meeting with Gottlieb re: Northstar investments	0.60
01/28/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with B. Schwartz regarding Black Elk settlement and Guidepost retention application, emails with J. Waggoner, C. Smyser, M. Okin, M. Dortch, C. Lindstrom, L. Gottlieb, A. Levine, A. Seidner, and D. Pohlman regarding Black Elk settlement, emails with B. Schwartz, L. Gottlieb, and N. Jacobson regarding Northstar.	0.40
01/28/17	Robert B. Winning	Review pleadings filed in Northstar bankruptcy case	1.60
01/29/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Seidner re Northstar (.4); review Patterson report (1.3); review A&M report (.2); emails re materials to SEC (.6); review motion for DIP financing (.3)	2.80
01/29/17	Robert B. Winning	Review materials from Platinum re: Northstar DIP and prepare report for L. Gottlieb; calls with Gottlieb re: same	2.40
01/30/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Calls and emails with Neal Jacobson re Northstar (.8); confer with Celia Barenholtz and Rob Winning re Northstar (.6); emails with Seider re Northstar (.6)	2.00
01/30/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Work on information to SEC re Northstar DIP loan	1.20
01/30/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Celia and Jacobson re Northstar	0.20
01/30/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Sander re Commitment letter	0.20
01/30/17	Alan Levine	Review application	0.30
01/30/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Draft and file correspondence to court re Texas settlement (1.4); correspondence re entities issues (0.2); revise memo re Receiver mandate (0.9); confer with C. Barenholtz re Northstar (0.3); confer with R. Winning and D. Pohlman re Northstar (0.4); confer with L.	9.20



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Horwitz re entities (0.2); revise Northstar emergency motion and supporting documents (5.8)	
01/30/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Discuss order to show cause with C. Barenholtz (0.2); review exemplar order to show cause for approval of transactions not in the ordinary course of business (0.5); reviewed local rules for the Eastern District of New York and Judge Irizarry's individual rules regarding orders to show cause (0.4); discuss order to show cause and supporting declarations with R. Winning and A. Seidner (0.6); prepare and revise memorandum of law in support of emergency motion by order to show cause for approval of the Receiver to provide a debtor-in-possession loan to Northstar Offshore Group, LLC (2.0); Prepared and revised declaration of Lawrence Gottlieb in support of motion re Northstar Offshore Group, LLC (1.8); Prepared and revised declaration of Bart M. Schwartz in support of motion re Northstar Offshore Group, LLC (1.5); discuss state of drafts with A. Seidner and planned reorganization of declarations (0.4); review and revise declarations of Lawrence Gottlieb and Bart M. Schwartz to move content related to bankruptcy to Gottlieb's declaration, and to only include information regarding business judgment to Schwartz's declaration (1.5); further review and revise memorandum of law in support of order to show cause (1.5); further revise Schwartz declaration based on comments from A. Seidner (0.5); further review and revise Gottlieb declaration based on comments from A. Seidner (0.3).	11.20
01/30/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Attention to Guidepost retention, including review of A. Collura mark-up, telephone calls with N. Jacobson regarding B. Schwartz rate and court approval of B. Schwartz rate, email with B. Schwartz regarding same, meetings and emails with D. Pohlman regarding same, review and edit revised applications, telephone	4.60



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		calls and emails with A. Seidner regarding consents, meeting with D. Pohlman regarding filing (.8); attention to Northstar DIP including preparation for and telephone call with N. Jacobson and L. Gottlieb regarding same, several telephone calls and meetings with L. Gottlieb regarding court approval, several meetings with D. Pohlman and A. Seidner regarding motion for court approval (1.5); telephone calls, meetings and emails regarding letter to court about Black Elk settlement and status of cancellation request (.3); emails and telephone call with B. Schwartz regarding court approvals under receivership order, draft memo regarding same and emails with A. Seidner regarding same (1.2); meeting with A. Levine regarding to dos and status (.5); emails with D. Burstein regarding Caymans trip and telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding same (.1); telephone call with D. Burstein regarding Abdalah issues (.2).	
01/30/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of argument for emergency motion to authorize Northstar DIP (2.1); related calls and meeting with Gottlieb and Barenholtz (1.3)	3.40
01/30/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of scope of liens securing: Northstar secured notes	0.90
01/31/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails with Celia, Robbie, Zach, Schwartz et al re Northstar (1.3); review draft of motion for EDNY (.3)	1.60
01/31/17	Alan Levine	Call with SEC about indemnification issues (SEC expressed no view) and other status matters	0.50
01/31/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Revise Northstar order to show cause and supporting documents (15.1)	15.10
01/31/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review and revise memorandum of law in support of order to show cause to approve Northstar debtor-in-possession loan (0.4); prepared proposed order for order to show cause (0.6); prepared declaration of Celia Barenholtz in support of order to show cause	3.20



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		(1.4); revised declaration of Lawrence Gottlieb in support of order to show cause based on R. Winning suggested edits (0.5); revised declaration of Bart M. Schwartz n support of order to show cause based on R. Winning suggested edits (0.3).	
01/31/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with B. Schwartz and D. Burstein regarding status, [REDACTED] and scheduling (.3); telephone call with D. Burstein regarding Tenaska (.2); numerous telephone calls and emails with L. Gottlieb, R. Winning, A. Seidner, D. Pohlman, B. Schwartz, and D. Burstein regarding hearing on Arena DIP and motion for court approval of PPCO Northstar DIP (.9); review draft of motion papers for approval of PPCO Northstar DIP and meeting with A. Seidner and D. Pohlman regarding same (1.0); prepare for team meeting (1.3); telephone call with A. Levine regarding consents (.1); telephone call with A. Levine and N. Jacobson regarding insurance, [REDACTED] and related matters and emails regarding same (.6).	4.40
01/31/17	Robert B. Winning	Research re: Northstar bankruptcy proceeding and second lien notes	2.80
01/31/17	Robert B. Winning	Comment on emergency motion to provide Northstar DIP and meeting and calls with Seidner re: same	1.90
Task Total:			574.00 534,009.50
Total Fees			\$540,477.00
15% Discount			(81,071.55)
Subtotal Fees			\$459,405.45



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Ann M. Mooney	965	2.10	2,026.50
Thomas R. Salley	995	6.50	6,467.50
Alan Levine	1375	32.00	44,000.00
Alan Levine	1295	13.00	16,835.00
Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	1175	183.80	215,965.00
Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	1110	21.10	23,421.00
Lawrence C. Gottlieb	1185	31.30	37,090.50
Lawrence C. Gottlieb	1120	5.50	6,160.00
Robert B. Winning	835	29.10	24,298.50
Abigail Belknap Seidner	670	209.30	140,231.00
Abigail Belknap Seidner	560	4.20	2,352.00
Daniel J. Pohlman	525	39.10	20,527.50
Ruben D. Morales	315	3.50	1,102.50

For costs and disbursements recorded through January 31, 2017 :

Certificate of Good Standing	5.00
Certificate of good standing	
Reproduction of Documents	249.60
Total Costs	\$254.60
Total:	\$459,660.05



May 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1755107
TX 03 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 1/31/2017-Invoice No. 1755107:		
Fees	\$	459,405.45
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	254.60
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	459,660.05

Cooley LLP
101 California Street, 5th floor
San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:
Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S
**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may
accrue late charges.



February 23, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1726576
CC 02 60031

330014-202



For services rendered through January 31, 2017

Fees	\$	43,842.15
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	43,842.15



330014-202
 [REDACTED]

Invoice Number: 1726576
 CC 02 60031

For services rendered through January 31, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS			
01/22/17	Alan Levine	Conference with Celia Barenholtz about [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]	1.00
01/23/17	Alan Levine	Meeting with Michael Klett and Robert Rittereiser to evaluate the PPVA claims in 1/22/17 letter from Warren Gluck (2.0); calls with client and [REDACTED] claim and closing (0.8)	2.80
01/24/17	Alan Levine	Call with Warren Gluck (0.5); call with [REDACTED] (0.5); review [REDACTED] documents (1.0); review original Operating Agreement and other documents for [REDACTED] (1.5); call with Robert Rittereiser and Michael Klett (0.5)	4.00
01/24/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Telephone conference and emails A. Levine	0.40
01/25/17	Alan Levine	Meeting with [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] re [REDACTED] transaction (2.0); calls with [REDACTED] (0.8); separate prep meeting with client for closing meeting (2.0)	4.80
01/26/17	Alan Levine	Two long calls with PPVA counsel (1.2); conference with client (Robert Rittereiser and Michael Klett) on reaction to [REDACTED] notice (1.5); review of Operating Agreement for definition of [REDACTED] (1.0); calls with David Steinberg re meaning of [REDACTED] (1.0)	4.70
01/26/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Review org chart and overview of [REDACTED] transaction (.5); telephone conference and emails David Steinberg re [REDACTED] transaction (.5); review correspondence re redemption notice and [REDACTED] (.5); preliminary review of [REDACTED] Agreement (1.0); review [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] documents (.5); review [REDACTED] operating agreement (.5); prepare email re [REDACTED] Value and related issues (.9); office conference A. Levine and conference call with Robert Rittereiser and Michael Klett re [REDACTED] Value and attributed stock in [REDACTED] notice (1.5); calls and emails with David Steinberg re meaning of [REDACTED] Value	6.30



330014-202
 [REDACTED]

Invoice Number: 1726576
 CC 02 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		(.4)	
01/27/17	Alan Levine	Multiple calls with client (1.0); with counsel for PPVA (1.4); with [REDACTED] all re notice of payment and legal issues; review of notice and agreements (1.1)	3.50
01/27/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Analysis of earlier distribution in respect of sale of [REDACTED] in preparation of drafting letter to Liquidator's counsel (.9); begin preparation of draft letter to Liquidator's counsel (1.0); review and revise letter to Liquidator's counsel (1.0); telephone conference A. Levine (.3); telephone conference D. Steinberg (.3); revise draft letter to reflect comments from group (.6); finalize letter and attention to emails (.3)	4.40
01/29/17	Alan Levine	Review emails and call with Robert Rittereiser	1.00
01/30/17	Alan Levine	Review with Robert Rittereiser upcoming transactions involving [REDACTED]	0.80
01/30/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Follow up with A. Levine re [REDACTED] warrant and weekend discussions (.2); follow up on [REDACTED] and ALS documents (.3); preliminary review of ALS Loan Agreement (1.0); preliminary review of PPCO Notes (1.0); preliminary review of Subsidiary Guaranty of PPCO Notes and Security Agreement (1.0); preliminary review of ALS LLC Agreement and amendment; and certain ancillary documents (1.0); prepare email overviewing understanding of transaction and open questions (1.0); research re assignments of life insurance policies and perfection of liens on such policies (.7); preliminary review of Alvarez and Marsal analysis of ALS, [REDACTED] and [REDACTED] transactions and intercompany loan spreadsheet (1.0); telephone conference Trey Rogers re ALS and [REDACTED] (.3); office conference A. Levine re ALS and [REDACTED] and review with R. Rittereiser (.8)	8.30
01/31/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Begin preliminary review of [REDACTED] Agreements (1.0); draft and calculate email re [REDACTED] lien on ALS account and possibly	3.90



330014-202
[REDACTED]

Invoice Number: 1726576
 CC 02 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		proceeds of disposition (.9); review sale proceeds allocation provisions in ALS loan documents and begin preparation of email re application of same (1.0); review and revise email re questions needed to confirm allocations and attention to follow up emails (1.0)	
Task Total:			45.90 51,579.00

Total Fees	\$51,579.00
15% Discount	(7,736.85)
Subtotal Fees	\$43,842.15

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Alan Levine	1375	22.60	31,075.00
Lynn D. Horwitz	880	23.30	20,504.00

Total:	\$43,842.15
---------------	--------------------



February 23, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

330014-202



Invoice Number: 1726576
CC 02 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 1/31/2017-Invoice No. 1726576:		
Fees	\$	43,842.15
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	43,842.15

Cooley LLP
101 California Street, 5th floor
San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:
Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S
**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may
accrue late charges.



February 23, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1726577
CC 02 60031

330014-203
D&O Issues

For services rendered through January 31, 2017

Fees	\$	8,559.92
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	8,559.92



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1726577
CC 02 60031

For services rendered through January 31, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
CASE ADMINISTRATION				
01/19/17	Alan Levine	Conference with Ann Mooney; review letters of demand of coverage	0.50	
01/30/17	Ann M. Mooney	Multiple telephone conversations with C. Barenholtz and A. Levine re D&O issues; conference call with client re insurance and indemnity issues; review coverage correspondence and background documents	3.80	
01/30/17	Alan Levine	Call with defense counsel on D&O (0.5); call with Bart Schwartz and other counsel (1.0)	1.50	
01/30/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Call with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, A. Mooney, A. Collura, and C. Barenholtz re indemnity issues	1.00	
01/30/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Attention to insurance matters including telephone call with A. Mooney and N. Jacobson regarding background (.5); telephone call and email with N. Jacobson regarding indemnification and email with A. Mooney and N. Jacobson regarding same (.1); call with B. Schwartz, A. A. Collura, A. Levine, A. Mooney, A. Seidner, and D. Burstein regarding insurance, indemnification and related issues (1.0); follow-up telephone call with A. Mooney (.2).	1.80	
01/31/17	Ann M. Mooney	Review and analyze coverage correspondence and other background documents re D&O insurance issues	0.90	
		Task Total:	9.50	10,070.50
Total Fees				\$10,070.50
15% Discount				(1,510.58)
Subtotal Fees				\$8,559.92



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1726577
CC 02 60031

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Ann M. Mooney	965	4.70	4,535.50
Alan Levine	1375	2.00	2,750.00
Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	1175	1.80	2,115.00
Abigail Belknap Seidner	670	1.00	670.00

Total: \$8,559.92



ATTORNEYS AT LAW

Palo Alto, CA

San Diego, CA

101 California

Los Angeles, CA

5th floor

Broomfield, CO

San Francisco, CA

Seattle, WA

94111-5800

New York, NY

MAIN 415 693-2000

Reston, VA

Washington, DC

February 23, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
 Management & Related Entities
 Guidepost Solutions LLC
 415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
 New York, NY 10017

www.cooley.com

Boston, MA

Taxpayer ID Number

Shanghai, P. R. China

94-1140085

London, United Kingdom

330014-203

Invoice Number: 1726577

D&O Issues

CC 02 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 1/31/2017-Invoice No. 1726577:		
Fees	\$	8,559.92
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	8,559.92

Cooley LLP

101 California Street, 5th floor
 San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:

Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
 Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S

**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
 and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may
 accrue late charges.



May 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

For services rendered through February 28, 2017

*** REVISED INVOICE --- REPLACES INVOICE NO.: 1739930 ***

Fees	\$	175,916.00
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	1,915.74
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	177,831.74



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

For services rendered through February 28, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
BUSINESS ANALYSIS				
02/09/17	Thomas R. Salley	Document review regarding authorized signatures for Cayman entities	0.20	
02/13/17	Thomas R. Salley	Emails regarding authority for Cayman entities	0.10	
02/21/17	Thomas R. Salley	Authorization of Cayman director	0.10	
		Task Total:	0.40	398.00
CASE ADMINISTRATION				
02/01/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Call with D. Burstein, H. Werblowski, Z. Steinberg, A. Mooney, and C. Barenholtz regarding ongoing litigation and outstanding fees due to lawyers for work performed in the ordinary course of business (1.0); Full team meeting with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, C. Barenholtz, and others regarding next steps (1.5)	2.50	
02/01/17	Alan Levine	Call with SEC about [REDACTED] (0.2); and then follow up on fact finding (0.5)	0.70	
02/01/17	Alan Levine	All hands meeting on variety of legal issues facing Receiver (Platinum Receiver reps) and Cooley	1.90	
02/01/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Revise Northstar order to show cause and supporting documents (9.6); meeting with Cooley and Guidepost re upcoming filings, portfolio issues, entities issues, and upcoming tasks (1.9)	11.50	
02/01/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review emails with B. Schwartz and D. Burstein regarding [REDACTED] (.1); call with D. Burstein, G. Duch, H. Werblowsky, A. Mooney, D. Pohlman, D. Steinberg, and S. Horowitz regarding status of litigation matters and receivership entities' counsel (1.0); review and revise drafts of motion papers for proposed PPCO Northstar DIP and telephone calls, meetings and emails regarding same and	8.50	



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		hearing on Arena with A. Seidner, R. Winning, and L. Gottlieb (4.5); telephone call with B. Parlin, W. Gluck, A. Levine, and K. Byrne regarding [REDACTED] and meeting and telephone call with A. Levine regarding same (.4); email with J. Waggoner regarding Black Elk settlement (.1); all hands meeting with B. Schwartz, M. Klett, D. Burstein, M. Chersevani, A. Levine, A. Seidner, A. Mooney, D. Pohlman and others (1.9); telephone calls and meetings with D. Pohlman and A. Mooney regarding D&O and indemnity issues (.5).	
02/01/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Calls with Celia re my declaration (.6); calls with Seider re Northstar hearing (.3); call with Bart and group about general matters (.9); call and emails with Bart re issues for Northstar investment (.7); review draft papers for motion to EDNY re Northstar (.5); calls with Winning re motion papers to EDNY (.8)	3.80
02/01/17	Robert B. Winning	Calls, correspondence and analysis re: Northstar hearing on Arena DIP and its affect on Receiver's motion for authorization to enter into PPCO DIP to Northstar	2.20
02/01/17	Robert B. Winning	Revisions to motion and supporting declarations for authority to provide Northstar DIP and related calls and correspondence	3.90
02/02/17	Lauren A. Reichardt	Research regarding ability of shareholders to remove management in chapter 11 under Texas law in connection with ongoing Northstar issues (3.2); Draft summary of research findings to L. Gottlieb (.5)	3.70
02/02/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review and revise declarations and memorandum of law for potential order to show cause regarding the contemplated Northstar debtor-in-possession loan, substantively checking cites and conforming cross references throughout all submissions (1.5).	1.50
02/02/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Revise Northstar order to show cause and supporting documents (5.8)	5.80
02/02/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone calls and meetings with A. Seidner	2.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		regarding status of PPCO DIP motion papers (.5), telephone call with L. Gottlieb regarding same (.3); emails with B. Schwartz regarding same (.1), review and revise B. Schwartz declaration and brief regarding Northstar DIP (1.3), emails with D. Burstein, A. Levine, K. Byrne re [REDACTED] and telephone call with A. Levine regarding same (.2), emails and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding Houlihan Lokey and email R. Rittereiser regarding same (.1).	
02/02/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails and calls with Bart re Northstar (.6); call with Seider re Cory hearing and declaration on Northstar (.3); calls with Celia Barenholtz re EDNY motion papers (.5)	1.40
02/02/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of proposed Arena DIP Order in Northstar bankruptcy case and prepare for and telephonically attend hearing re: same; follow up correspondence	2.30
02/02/17	Robert B. Winning	Continued revision to declarations in support of motion for authority to provide PPCO Northstar DIP loan and related calls and correspondence	1.80
02/02/17	Robert B. Winning	Legal research re: corporate governance rights in Northstar bankruptcy	0.70
02/03/17	Alan Levine	Call with Robert Rittereiser about [REDACTED] (0.3); and review [REDACTED] agreement (0.3)	0.60
02/03/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Review entities addition issues (1.4); confer with C. Barenholtz re entities, Northstar, and investor relations issues (0.3); confer with D. Pohlman re DOJ stay opposition (0.1); review opposition to stay (0.3)	2.10
02/03/17	Lauren A. Reichardt	Review docket of G. Steinhauer for information pertaining to a PPCO judgment (.8); Review motions and other documents pertaining to same (.4) and draft findings for L. Gottlieb (.3)	1.50
02/03/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call with A. Levine and R. Rittereiser and telephone call with R. Rittereiser regarding [REDACTED] (.5), review draft	1.00



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		letter to SEC regarding PPVA Fund and emails with D. Burstein and A. Seidner regarding same (.1), review and circulate email from B. Schwartz regarding Northstar and related matters and telephone call with A. Seidner regarding same (.1), meeting with A. Seidner regarding website, EDNY docket, and to dos (.2), emails with B. Schwartz and A. Levine regarding ████████ expenses (.1).	
02/03/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails with Bart re Northstar	0.30
02/04/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with B. Schwartz et al regarding misc matters.	0.10
02/04/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails with Seider re Northstar developments	0.30
02/05/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Several telephone calls and emails with Northstar DIP.	0.30
02/05/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Bart, Tim, Seider et al	1.00
02/06/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with L. Gottlieb re Northstar (0.1); confer with C. Barenholtz re Northstar order to show cause (0.4); revise order to show cause papers (1.0)	1.50
02/06/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call with A. Seidner regarding entities issues (.2), meeting with A. Levine regarding call with W. Burck (.4), telephone call with W. Burck and A. Levine (.5), emails with N. Jacobson, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein and A. Levine regarding M. MacInnis letter and consents (.2).	1.30
02/06/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Bart re Northstar (.2); call with Abigail re Northstar and motion to EDNY (.3)	0.50
02/06/17	Alan Levine	Call with Bill Burke about pending requests for consents to Receiver application (0.5); confer with Celia Barenholtz on issues relating to joining orphans (0.5)	1.00
02/06/17	Robert B. Winning	Calls with counsel to Eleanor, Gottlieb and Rothenberg re: status of Northstar DIP loan	1.20
02/07/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with D. Burstein regarding orphans, telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding orphan entities, consent to receivership.	0.10



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/07/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call Ritterreiser re EDNY motion in Northstar	0.20
02/08/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with R. Winning re Northstar order to show cause (0.3); confer with C. Barenholtz re Northstar order to show cause (0.1); confer with C. Barenholtz and L. Gottlieb re Northstar (0.3); review entities issues (2.5); confer with D. Pohlman re order to show cause (0.1); confer with C. Barenholtz and A. Levine re Northstar (0.5)	3.80
02/08/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review transcript of North Star bankruptcy proceeding to highlight sections of the order related to the proposed PPCO debtor in possession financing agreement (0.8); research regarding sections of the U.S. Code related to receivers (1.4).	2.20
02/08/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Email with A. Levine regarding clawback actions (.1); Northstar - telephone calls with A. Seidner, telephone call with A. Seidner and L. Gottlieb, meeting with A. Levine and A. Seidner regarding DIP approval motion (.9); email with B. Schwartz regarding sales, review statute and telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding same (.4), review Walker consent letter, emails and/or telephone calls with A. Seidner and D. Burstein regarding same (.4); telephone call with R. Ritterreiser regarding Houlihan Lokey retainer terms and telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding same (.2).	2.00
02/08/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Celia and Abigail re Northstar (.3); emails with Burstein re AEX and APC (.2); calls on Centurian (.3)	0.80
02/08/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re Northstar motion	0.20
02/08/17	Alan Levine	Northstar: review proposed application to EDNY with Celia Barenholtz and Abby Seidner and make suggestions	0.50
02/08/17	Robert B. Winning	Calls and correspondence re Northstar DIP issues	1.80
02/09/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Review receivership statutes and correspond with D. Pohlman re statute research (0.7); review entities issues (1.7); correspondence re	3.00



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
 TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Chicago stay, Arabella, and order to show cause (0.6)	
02/09/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails.	0.10
02/09/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re Arabella and Northstar	0.40
02/09/17	Alan Levine	Northstar: Review proposed papers and email to Bart Schwartz	0.50
02/10/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with D. Pohlman re potential claims and distribution issues; confer with C. Barenholtz re entities and distribution issues	0.40
02/10/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call with D. Burstein regarding various matters; follow-up telephone call with A. Seidner regarding to dos.	0.60
02/13/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re Northstar (0.1); revise Northstar authorization application documents (1.5)	1.60
02/13/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone calls with A. Levine and B. Schwartz regarding authority, Northstar and related issues, emails with N. Jacobson, B. Schwartz, A. Levine, and D. Burstein regarding approvals and related issues, telephone call with A. Seidner regarding Northstar, status of approvals (1.3); review D. Pohlman memo and cases regarding indemnification and email D. Pohlman, A. Mooney, A. Levine and A. Seidner regarding same (2.2).	3.50
02/13/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review and revise documents related to application to provide debtor-in-possession financing for Northstar (1.6)	1.60
02/13/17	Alan Levine	Meeting with Receiver on several legal issues	1.00
02/14/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re entities issues and Northstar (0.1); research and correspondence re entities issues (0.6); review reply brief re stay of civil case (0.4); review court orders (0.2)	1.30
02/14/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Meeting with A. Levine, A. Mooney and D. Pohlman regarding D&O and indemnification issues (1.0); meeting with D. Pohlman	5.90



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		regarding legal research items (.3); telephone call with D. Burstein regarding Houlihan Lokey, attorneys application, and related items (.4); telephone calls and emails with A. Seidner regarding waiver, docket (.1); meeting with A. Collura, S. Horowitz, H. Werblowsky, D. Burstein, A. Levine, A. Mooney, and D. Pohlman regarding D&O and indemnification issues (2.8); meeting with A. Levine, S. Horowitz, H. Werblowsky, D. Burstein, and A. Collura regarding PMNY receivership (.8); meeting with D. Burstein regarding various matters including Houlihan Lokey, dispositions (.5).	
02/14/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Celia , Baum etc re AEX (.6); review my declaration for EDNY motion for \$5 million DIP approval (.4)	1.00
02/14/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Meeting regarding D&O policies, current advancements made to individual defendants, and other issues with H. Werblowsky, S. Horowitz, D. Burstein, A. Collura, A. Levine, A. Mooney, and C. Barenholtz (2.0).	2.00
02/14/17	Alan Levine	Call with defense counsel re indemnification	0.50
02/15/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re entities issues, Northstar, and court filings (0.4); draft letter re court filings (1.4); research and correspondence re entities issues (1.6); review defendant letters (0.2); correspondence with Chicago counsel re stay (0.1)	3.70
02/15/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Prepare for and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding new receivership entities (.2), telephone call with N. Jacobson, D. Burstein, C. Barenholtz, and M. McInnis regarding same (.3); meeting with A. Seidner regarding entities and letter to court regarding filing issues (.4); follow-up telephone calls and/or emails regarding new entities application with N. Jacobson, W. Burck, M. McInnis, and M. Ziegler (.1); meeting with A. Levine regarding entities issues, docket issues and Northstar (.2); revise Northstar papers and emails	7.10



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		regarding same with N. Jacobson, L. Gottlieb, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, A. Levine and A. Seidner (4.0); attention to administrative matters (2.); review Houlihan Lokey retainer agreement, draft email to SEC regarding same and floor for dispositions, emails with D. Burstein and B. Schwartz regarding same (.8); prepare for and telephone call with L. Gottlieb, M. Baum, J. Weiner, and H. Borin regarding Arabella (.8); emails regarding D&O matters (.1).	
02/15/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review Bart declaration re DIP loan application (.4); review motion and orders re DIP loan application	0.80
02/15/17	Alan Levine	Review draft of Northstar papers	0.50
02/16/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re entities issues, Northstar, and court filings (0.1); confer with defense counsel re Northstar consents (0.4); finalize and file Northstar authorization application (1.7); finalize and file letter re court filings (1.0); research and correspondence re entities issues (0.5); correspondence with Chicago counsel re stay (0.2)	3.90
02/16/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Prepare for and call with T. Flynn, A. Fan, and D. Burstein regarding Houlihan Lokey retainer issues and follow-up call with D. Burstein regarding same (.9); review R. Rittereiser memo regarding Houlihan Lokey and revise and circulate draft email to N. Jacobson regarding same (1.5); emails with A. Collura, D. Burstein, and R. Rittereiser regarding retention payments (.1); review draft preliminary injunction and email N. Jacobson regarding same (.1); draft letter to insurer regarding insurance refunds and email regarding same to A. Mooney, D. Pohlman, and A. Levine (.4); preparation for call with W. Burck and N. Jacobson regarding additional receivership entities, Northstar and Walkers waiver, and follow-up emails regarding same (1.5); final revisions to Northstar papers and	8.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		numerous telephone calls and/or emails regarding same with L. Gottlieb, D. Burstein, A. Seidner and D. Pohlman (3.5); review and revise letter to court regarding filings protocol and emails and telephone calls regarding same with A. Levine, A. Seidner, D. Burstein (.5).	
02/16/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revised Northstar application and supporting declaration of Bart M. Schwartz to reflect comments from the S.E.C. and from D. Burstein (2.1); proofread and prepared execution copy of Schwartz declaration (0.4); prepared documents for filing and coordinated with filing clerks (1.5); review Northstar application papers prior to filing (2.5); reviewed emails and correspondence to find letter previously sent in relation to Daniel Small arbitration (0.3).	6.70
02/17/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with H. Gonzalez re Northstar filings (0.2); confer with C. Barenholtz re entities application (0.7); revise Northstar application (0.5); prepare entities application materials (4.3); confer with fund administrator re entities consents (0.2); draft letter to administrator re entities and receivership information (0.7); confer with C. Barenholtz, D. Burstein, M. Macinnis, N. Jacobson, W. Burck, D. Koffmann, and M. Ziegler re M. Nordlicht consents (0.5); confer with C. Barenholtz, D. Burstein, M. Macinnis, and M. Ziegler re entities application (0.3); confer with counsel for J. Shulse re Northstar (0.4); confer with D. Burstein, C. Barenholtz, L. Gottlieb, and B. Schwartz re Northstar (0.3); confer with defense counsel re Northstar consents (0.3)	8.40
02/17/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails and telephone calls with N. Jacobson, L. Gottlieb, A. Seidner, and D. Pohlman regarding Northstar filing issues and consents (.3); emails with R. Winning regarding Black Elk settlement agreement (.1); telephone calls, emails and meetings with D. Burstein, A. Mooney, and D. Pohlman regarding D&O	7.40



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		refund (.4); emails and telephone calls R. Rittereiser, D. Burstein, N. Jacobson, D. Pohlman regarding Houlihan Lokey (.9); emails and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding attorney retainers (.1); emails with D. Pohlman and N. Jacobson regarding 28USC 2004, etc. issue (.1); draft letter application regarding unsupervised entities application, telephone calls, emails and/or meetings regarding same and related matters with N. Jacobson, M. Ziegler, M. McInnis, J. Dorchak, W. Burck, K. Koffmann, A. Seidner regarding same and corporate governance issues regarding unsupervised entities (5.5).	
02/17/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re letter submitted by Jeffrey Shulse regarding the Northstar DIP Loan.	0.20
02/17/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Coordinated revised filings to correct issues with Northstar DIP application filing caused by technical problems (3.2); reviewed sections of the U.S. Code pertaining to receivers and researched requirements for selling personalty (0.6).	3.80
02/17/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of Black Elk settlement and related calls and correspondence	2.70
02/19/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Draft declaration of D. Burstein in support of entities application (1.5); draft letter re Northstar consent (0.5)	2.00
02/21/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Attention to motion to add entities, including reviewing and revising letter application and D. Burstein declaration, telephone calls and emails with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, A. Levine, and A. Seidner, regarding same and to dos (2.0), emails with A. Mooney and B. Schwartz regarding indemnity and waterfall, meetings and emails with D. Pohlman regarding legal research regarding same (.2); telephone calls with D. Burstein, A. Mooney, and A. Levine, attempted telephone call with W. Burck and emails with B. Schwartz and D. Burstein regarding insurance refund (.3); review and revise draft Black Elk settlement	4.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		agreement (1.0); emails with D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, N. Jacobson, K. McGrath and R. Rittereiser regarding miscellaneous receivership matters (1.0).	
02/21/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Revise entities application and supporting documents (6.7); correspondence re Northstar (0.7); confer with C. Barenholtz re entities application (0.3); confer with fund administrator re entities consents (0.1); confer with R. Winning re Northstar (0.1)	7.90
02/21/17	Alan Levine	Governance issues with PMNY including calls with Bart Schwartz, Dan Burstein	0.50
02/22/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Attention to application to add entities including telephone calls and emails with A. Levine, A. Seidner, and D. Burstein, review M. McInnis declaration and changes to application, emails with SEC, D. Burstein, and A. Levine regarding changes to receiver order (1.3); telephone calls and emails with D. Burstein and M. Ayer (.1); telephone calls with D. Burstein and M. Ziegler regarding server issue (.2); telephone call with A. Levine and W. Burck regarding D&O refund, entities, etc., and email with B. Schwartz regarding same (.5); revisions to Black Elk settlement agreement and email A. Levine, A. Seidner, L. Gottlieb, and R. Winning regarding same (2.0); review and revise memo regarding retention program and telephone calls and emails with D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, and A. Levine regarding same (1.0).	5.10
02/22/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call and emails with Michael Mann re Shulse's objection to DIP loan by Receiver in North Star case	0.40
02/22/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Revise entities application and supporting documents (1.9); correspondence re Northstar (0.1); confer with C. Barenholtz re entities application (0.2); confer with D. Pohlman re website (0.1); revise Black Elk settlement agreement (0.2)	2.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/22/17	Robert B. Winning	Correspond with Gottlieb re: Black Elk settlement and related analysis	0.90
02/23/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Legal research regarding claw back agreements and ability to avoid working a waiver of attorney client privilege when allowing full access to email servers (1.8).	1.80
02/23/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Call re PPVA liquidator issues (1.4); confer with C. Barenholtz re receiver order and PPVA issues (0.2); confer with D. Pohlman re entities (0.1); review law firm issues (0.5)	2.20
02/23/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with N. Jacobson, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, and A. Levine regarding revised receiver order (.1); emails regarding PPVA issues and telephone call with A. Levine, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, M. Klett, R. Rittereiser, and A. Seidner regarding same and [REDACTED] (2.0); numerous telephone calls and emails with A. Levine, [REDACTED], R. Rittereiser, R. Havenstrite, B. Romney, B. Schwartz, M. Klett, D. Burstein, N. Jacobson and K. McGrath regarding [REDACTED] CAT equipment (3.1), email B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, A. Levine, and A. Seidner regarding telephone call with W. Burck and entities application (.1); review revised retention memo and email to E. Lewis (.4); review reservation of rights letter and email B. Schwartz, A. Levine, L. Gottlieb, and D. Burstein regarding same, telephone call with M. Klett regarding same and [REDACTED] (1.1); telephone call with D. Koffmann and email B. Schwartz regarding same (.1); emails with D. Pohlman, A. Levine, A. Seidner regarding PPVA/service issue (.1).	7.10
02/23/17	Alan Levine	Issues with [REDACTED]: call with Robert Rittereiser (0.5); call with [REDACTED] (0.5); call with [REDACTED] (0.4); review Order and documents (0.5)	1.90
02/23/17	Alan Levine	Call with Receiver on various issues	0.80
02/23/17	Alan Levine	Review [REDACTED] claim	0.30



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/24/17	Lauren A. Reichardt	Review Black Elk plan for issue of standing to objection to claims per L. Gottlieb (.4)	0.40
02/24/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Legal research regarding whether providing access to email server, subject to a claw back agreement, would work a waiver of privilege, and other related issues such as investor confidentiality concerns in connection with proposed information sharing agreement between PPCO and PPVA (4.9); discussed status of current projects and research findings with C. Barenholtz (0.3).	5.20
02/24/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re entities application, Black Elk settlement, and PPVA issues (0.2); revise entities application documents (1.0)	1.20
02/24/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call with A. Fajardo (BNY) and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same (.2); telephone calls and/or emails with D. Burstein, D. Koffmann, B. Schwartz, A. Levine and SEC regarding preliminary injunction consent and preliminary injunction provisions (.4); emails regarding retention plan with D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, D. Walsh and A. Levine (.2); emails with B. Schwartz, A. Levine and K. Pakenham regarding taxable settlement fund (.1); emails with B. Schwartz and D. Koffmann regarding database and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same and Strategic (.1); review docket entries and email A. Seidner regarding same (.1); emails and telephone calls with D. Burstein and D. Koffmann regarding Walker consent (.1); telephone calls and emails with A. Seidner, M. Ziegler, and D. Burstein regarding entities application and related matters (.1); meetings, telephone calls, and emails with D. Pohlman regarding information needed regarding ordinary course attorneys application (.2); emails, telephone calls and/or meetings with A. Levine, D. Pohlman and D. Burstein regarding PPVA/server issue (.8); emails and telephone calls regarding [REDACTED] with A.	7.10



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Levine, M. Klett, R. Rittereiser, D. Burstein, and Z. Steinberg (.9); draft [REDACTED] demand and revise [REDACTED] reservation of rights letter and telephone calls and/or emails regarding same with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, A. Levine, R. Rittereiser and M. Klett (1.5); review and comment on D. Pohlman draft memos regarding D&O and waterfall and meeting with D. Pohlman regarding same (1.7), emails with A. Mooney, A. Levine, D. Pohlman regarding D&O issues (.1); emails with B. Schwartz, A. Levine and L. Gottlieb regarding SEC meeting (.1); attention to Black Elk settlement including telephone calls and/or emails with J. Waggoner and L. Gottlieb, A. Levine, A. Seidner, and N. Jacobson regarding same (.5).	
02/27/17	Lauren A. Reichardt	Draft language for L. Gottlieb regarding Receiver standing in Black Elk bankruptcy	0.30
02/27/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call with A. Levine, N. Jacobson, K. McGrath, and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same and related matters (.8); emails regarding PPVA issues, review and revise agreement with PPVA regarding funding and email regarding server issues (.8); emails regarding various tasks and projects (.8).	2.40
02/27/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re entities and Black Elk issues (0.1); revise entities application documents (0.5); call M. MacInnis counsel (0.1); research deposition confidentiality issues (1.0); revise memos re indemnity and distributions (2.6); confer with J. SanFilippo counsel re claims (0.2); correspondence re J. SanFilippo claims (0.5)	5.00
02/28/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with D. Pohlman and C. Lindstrom re deposition confidentiality (1.1); review draft declaration for retention application (1.2); call with C. Barenholtz, D. Pohlman, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, and A. Collura re upcoming filings and consent issues (1.0); confer with J. SanFilippo counsel and A. Levine re claims (0.1); confer with D. Burstein re settlement	4.40



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
		fund (0.1); confer with L. Gottlieb re Northstar opposition (0.2); confer with C. Barenholtz re SEC meeting (0.1); review correspondence re PPVA server (0.2); correspondence with D. Pohlman re [REDACTED] (0.4)		
02/28/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Group call with B. Schwartz, A. Collura, D. Burstein, C. Barenholtz, A. Seidner regarding ongoing project status, D&O issues, proposed modification to PI, among other issues (1.0); review black elk transcript, highlighting to designate portions of testimony as confidential or as highly confidential, as appropriate (1.4); discuss with A. Seidner regarding transcript designation project (0.2).	2.60	
02/28/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails and telephone calls with Guidepost and Cooley regarding miscellaneous receivership matters (1.0), Rittereiser declaration; telephone call with A. Mooney (.1); status telephone call with B. Schwartz, A. Collura, D. Burstein, A. Seidner, and D. Pohlman regarding receivership matters (1.0); review and revise draft Rittereiser declaration and telephone call with R. Rittereiser and D. Pohlman regarding same (1.0).	3.10	
02/28/17	Robert B. Winning	Meeting with Gottlieb and discrete research re: Black Elk Settlement	1.40	
Task Total:			227.10	203,351.50
EMPLOYEE BENEFITS/PENSIONS				
02/23/17	Elizabeth L. Lewis	Receipt and review of employee retention memo for ongoing Platinum employees the Receiver wishes to continue to retain: email correspondence with C. Barenholtz re: same	0.90	
Task Total:			0.90	949.50
TAX ISSUES				
02/27/17	William L. Castleberry	Review section 468B rules in connection to	1.70	



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		creation of a qualified settlement fund and draft email	
Task Total:			1.70 2,261.00

Total Fees **\$206,960.00**

15% Discount (31,044.00)

Subtotal Fees **\$175,916.00**

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Thomas R. Salley	995	.40	398.00
Elizabeth L. Lewis	1055	.90	949.50
Alan Levine	1375	10.70	14,712.50
Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	1175	78.20	91,885.00
William L. Castleberry	1330	1.70	2,261.00
Lawrence C. Gottlieb	1185	11.30	13,390.50
Robert B. Winning	835	18.90	15,781.50
Abigail Belknap Seidner	670	72.20	48,374.00
Lauren A. Reichardt	595	5.90	3,510.50
Daniel J. Pohlman	525	29.90	15,697.50

For costs and disbursements recorded through February 28, 2017 :

Messenger Service	35.10
COURTS/USDC-NY-E-P	150.00
Wells Fargo Bank N.A.	
Drop off courtesy copy to Edny 1/30/2017; USDC-EDNY Jazmin Patino	125.00
Drop off courtesy copy to Edny 1/30/2017 Jazmin Patino	125.00
Reproduction of Documents	151.35



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

Research Database / Document Retrieval

1,329.29

Total Costs

\$1,915.74

Total:

\$177,831.74



May 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1755119
TX 03 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 2/28/2017-Invoice No. 1755119:		
Fees	\$	175,916.00
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	1,915.74
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	177,831.74

Cooley LLP
101 California Street, 5th floor
San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:
Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S
**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may
accrue late charges.



March 7, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1732303
CC 02 60031

330014-202



For services rendered through February 28, 2017

Fees	\$	9,995.15
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	9,995.15



330014-202
 [REDACTED]

Invoice Number: 1732303
 CC 02 60031

For services rendered through February 28, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/02/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Review [REDACTED] Credit Agreement and eleven amendments (1.6); review related Notes, Participation Agreement and assignments of participations; (1.3) prepare email re status and open items noting near term maturity of facility (.9); attention to emails re same (.3)	4.10
02/07/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	ALS - Emails A. Levine	0.30
02/09/17	Alan Levine	Review [REDACTED] ALS transaction documents	1.00
02/13/17	Alan Levine	Call with Holland & Knight (Parlin) on common legal issues for [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]	0.80
02/14/17	Alan Levine	Meeting with Lynn Horwitz on [REDACTED] related issues	0.50
02/14/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Office conference A. Levine; attention to ALS documents	0.50
02/16/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	ALS; prepare summary email	0.90
02/22/17	Alan Levine	Call with Guidepost people on [REDACTED]	0.30
02/24/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Prepare email re [REDACTED] documents	0.60
02/27/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Review Northstar documents and email A. Levine	2.90

Total Fees **\$11,759.00**

15% Discount (1,763.85)

Subtotal Fees **\$9,995.15**

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Alan Levine	1375	2.60	3,575.00
Lynn D. Horwitz	880	9.30	8,184.00

Total: **\$9,995.15**



March 7, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
 Management & Related Entities
 Guidepost Solutions LLC
 415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
 New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
 5th floor
 San Francisco, CA
 94111-5800
 MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
 94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
 San Diego, CA
 Los Angeles, CA
 Broomfield, CO
 Seattle, WA
 New York, NY
 Reston, VA
 Washington, DC
 Boston, MA
 Shanghai, P. R. China
 London, United Kingdom

330014-202



Invoice Number: 1732303
 CC 02 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 2/28/2017-Invoice No. 1732303:		
Fees	\$	9,995.15
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	9,995.15

Outstanding Balance from prior Invoices as of 3/7/2017 *(May not reflect recent payments)*

<u>Invoice Number</u>	<u>Invoice Date</u>	<u>Balance</u>	<u>Late Charges</u>	<u>Balance Due</u>
1726576	2/23/2017	43,842.15	0.00	43,842.15
Total Outstanding Balance from prior Invoices <i>(Disregard if paid)</i>			\$	43,842.15
Total Amount Due on Current and Prior Invoices			\$	53,837.30



330014-202
[REDACTED]

Invoice Number: 1732303
CC 02 60031

Cooley LLP
101 California Street, 5th floor
San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:
Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S
**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may accrue late charges.



March 30, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1739900
CC 02 60031

330014-203
D&O Issues

For services rendered through February 28, 2017

***** REVISED INVOICE --- REPLACES INVOICE NO.: 132304 *****

Fees	\$	36,928.67
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	19.65
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	36,948.32



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1739900
CC 02 60031

For services rendered through February 28, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
CASE ADMINISTRATION			
02/01/17	Ann M. Mooney	Conference call with B. Schwartz, his team and Cooley team re multiple issues (1.80); conference call re litigation status, attorney approvals and issues (1.20); review D&O policy terms and coverage correspondence (1.20); e-mails with outside defense counsel and carrier counsel (.50)	4.70
02/01/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Discuss indemnity research with C. Barenholtz (0.1); call with A. Mooney regarding D&O and indemnity issues (0.1); legal research on advancement of legal fees in the receivership context (3.2); discuss preliminary research findings with C. Barenholtz (0.2)	3.60
02/01/17	Alan Levine	Review insurance issues and conversation with defense counsel	0.50
02/02/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Legal research regarding advancement of legal fees and indemnity in the SEC receivership context, focusing on exploring whether similar advancement issues were litigated in other large receiverships, such as the Wextrust receivership and the Stanford and Petters Ponzi-schemes (0.9); reviewed precedent relied on in similar litigations over advancement issues (0.9).	1.80
02/02/17	Ann M. Mooney	Telephone conversation with S. Schechter, counsel for Tokio Marine (.50); telephone conversation with A. Collura (.20); review letter from D. Silver (.30); e-mail to S. Horowitz re notice of service of subpoena (.10)	1.10
02/03/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Research regarding advancement issues with an eye to cases where advancement was requested from funds that had been placed under receivership, either in the context of civil forfeiture or in the context of an SEC receivership (3.3); prepare summary of research on advancement and indemnity	5.30



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1739900
CC 02 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		issues, [REDACTED] (2.0).	
02/05/17	Ann M. Mooney	E-mail to H. Werblowsky re insurance issues	0.10
02/06/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Legal research on indemnity issues as frequently raised in receivership context and analyzing the relationship between how requests for reimbursement for legal fees are treated in the receivership, asset forfeiture, and bankruptcy context, and summarizing litigation positions taken by criminal defendants with respect to indemnity actions in similar large receiverships (0.4); organized case notes and created summary of cases re same (2.7).	3.10
02/06/17	Ann M. Mooney	E-mail exchange with B. Schwartz re indemnification request	0.10
02/07/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Prepare summary of research on indemnity issues as frequently raised in receivership context and analyzing the relationship between how requests for reimbursement for legal fees are treated in the receivership, asset forfeiture, and bankruptcy context, and summarizing litigation positions taken by criminal defendants with respect to indemnity actions in similar large receiverships (3.3).	3.30
02/08/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise and streamline summary of research on indemnity issues as frequently raised in receivership context and analyzing the relationship between how requests for reimbursement for legal fees are treated in the receivership, asset forfeiture, and bankruptcy context, and provide backing caselaw for review by A. Mooney and C. Barenholtz (2.0).	2.00
02/09/17	Ann M. Mooney	Review memorandum re indemnification obligation and underlying cases (.60); review coverage letters from excess carriers (.50)	1.10
02/13/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Follow up research on D&O insurance policies based on feedback from C. Barenholtz and prepared email summarizing same (1.3).	1.30



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1739900
CC 02 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/14/17	Ann M. Mooney	Meeting with Cooley team re D&O insurance and indemnity issues (1.00); review indemnity agreements (.50); meeting with Cooley team, H. Werblowsky and S. Horowitz re D&O insurance and indemnity issues (2.00); follow-up meeting with A. Levine re strategy (.30)	3.80
02/14/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Meeting With C. Barenholtz, A. Levine, and A. Mooney to discuss D&O, advancement, and indemnity research and to discuss next steps in formulating responses to requests for advancement, ordering priority of payments of D&O policy proceeds, and other related issues. (1.1); discussed structure of D&O, advancement, and indemnity memorandum with C. Barenholtz. (0.3); legal research regarding advancement and indemnification issues (1.2).	2.60
02/14/17	Alan Levine	Meeting with Ann Mooney and Platinum people (Susan Horowitz, Dan Burstein, Harvey Werblowsky) on issue relating to indemnification and D&O coverage	2.00
02/15/17	Ann M. Mooney	Conference call with S. Schechter (counsel for primary D&O carrier), H. Werblowsky and others re status of D&O insurance payments and issues (.50); telephone conversation with A. Levine re D&O insurance and indemnity issues (.20); communications with A. Collura re insurance payment issue (.20)	0.90
02/15/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Legal research regarding D&O and advancement issues, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.4); legal research [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (2.4).	3.80
02/16/17	Ann M. Mooney	Attention to excess D&O policy issues and communications with S. Horowitz and H. Werblowsky re same (.80); e-mail to M. Sommer (.10)	0.90



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1739900
 CC 02 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/17/17	Ann M. Mooney	Prepare letter to USSIC re payments (.60); communications with excess carriers' counsel (.10); communications with internal team and B. Schwartz re D&O insurance and indemnity issues (1.20)	1.90
02/17/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Prepare letter to primary-level director and officer insurance carrier requesting that they hold payment on reimbursement of funds that PPVA and PPCO may both have an interest in (1.5).	1.50
02/20/17	Ann M. Mooney	Communications with A. Levine and H. Werblowsky re M. Sommer's request for D&O insurance information (.30)	0.30
02/21/17	Ann M. Mooney	Communications with M. Sommer re D&O insurance policies and excess carriers' coverage correspondence (.50); telephone conversation with A. Levine and C. Barenholtz re status of payments and issues (.40)	0.90
02/22/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Prepare and revise memorandum explaining the advancement rights as they relate to receiverships, including how priority structures in liquidation plans could be used to argue that receivers have the ability to control the flow of D&O policy proceeds and other related issues (6.1).	6.10
02/22/17	Alan Levine	Review new status of Indemnification and call with counsel for Mark Nordlicht	0.80
02/23/17	Ann M. Mooney	Revise e-mail to counsel to criminal defendants (.15); e-mails to A. Levine and C. Barenholtz (.15)	0.30
02/24/17	Ann M. Mooney	Prepare e-mail to B. Schwartz re communication with counsel for criminal defendants re excess insurance issues	0.50
02/24/17	Alan Levine	Review indemnification issue and position for defense counsel	0.80
02/25/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review and revise memorandum summarizing advancement and indemnification obligations, incorporating more detail regarding indemnification obligations.	4.40



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1739900
CC 02 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
02/26/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Reviewed and revised memorandum regarding advancement and indemnification issues based on feedback from C. Barenholtz.	1.60
02/27/17	Ann M. Mooney	Review draft memorandum re indemnity and insurance issues	0.50
02/28/17	Ann M. Mooney	Communication with D. Burstein re status of insurance payments	0.10
Task Total:			61.70 43,445.50

Total Fees **\$43,445.50**

15% Discount (6,516.83)

Subtotal Fees **\$36,928.67**

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Ann M. Mooney	965	17.20	16,598.00
Alan Levine	1375	4.10	5,637.50
Daniel J. Pohlman	525	40.40	21,210.00

For costs and disbursements recorded through February 28, 2017 :

Reproduction of Documents 19.65

Total Costs **\$19.65**

Total: **\$36,948.32**



March 30, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

330014-203
D&O Issues

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1739900
CC 02 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 2/28/2017-Invoice No. 1739900:		
Fees	\$	36,928.67
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	19.65
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	36,948.32

Cooley LLP
101 California Street, 5th floor
San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:
Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S
**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may
accrue late charges.



May 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

330014-201

Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

For services rendered through March 31, 2017

*** REVISED INVOICE -- REPLACES INVOICE NO.: 1743486 ***

Fees	\$	222,175.55
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	4,758.89
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	226,934.44



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

For services rendered through March 31, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
BUSINESS ANALYSIS				
03/13/17	Thomas R. Salley	Authority issues; review Nordlicht attorney emails regarding authority of non-investor entities; A. Seidner regarding extent of receivership; exculpation issue	0.50	
03/24/17	Thomas R. Salley	C. Barenholtz regarding Cayman vs. U.S. entities; charts, email regarding receivership issues	0.50	
		Task Total:	1.00	995.00
CASE ADMINISTRATION				
02/28/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review DIP loan draft	1.60	
02/28/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Add language for settlement	0.20	
03/01/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Call with C. Barenholtz and SEC staff re preliminary injunction and receiver order (0.5); confer with J. SanFilippo counsel and A. Levine re claims (0.5); confer with C. Barenholtz and D. Burstein re preliminary injunction, receiver order, and PPVA server (0.6); confer with L. Gottlieb re Northstar and Black Elk (0.2); revise entities application materials (2.3); revise Black Elk settlement agreement (0.5); confer with C. Barenholtz re application revisions, Northstar, Black Elk, and privilege issues (0.5); review privilege preliminary injunction proposal (0.3); review PPVA server information sharing agreement (0.7); review proposed investments (0.5); correspondence re SEC call (0.7); review proposed extension letter (0.3)	7.60	
03/01/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Confer with Barenholtz re PPVA issues	0.20	
03/01/17	Alan Levine	Review [REDACTED] payoff documents and advising on demand letter	0.80	
03/01/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call with A. Seidner, N. Jacobson and K. McGrath regarding preliminary	4.30	



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		injunction order and receivership order and emails with B. Schwartz regarding same (.6); review draft information sharing agreement, emails with D. Burstein regarding same, telephone calls with L. Gottlieb, A. Seidner and D. Burstein regarding same and other receivership matters, prepare bullet points regarding key terms (2.3); emails regarding life insurance portfolio (.1); telephone calls, emails and meetings with A. Seidner regarding various matters including Northstar, Black Elk settlement (.5); emails and/or telephone calls with A. Levine, D. Burstein, S. Horowitz, R. Rittereiser, M. Klett, B. Schwartz, and D. Steinberg regarding [REDACTED] and review; comment on and revise demand letter and reservation of rights agreements (.6); emails with N. Jacobson, K. McGrath, A. Seidner, D. Burstein and D. Koffmann regarding PPCO answer (.1); emails regarding R. Rittereiser declaration (.1).	
03/01/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Comment on settlement with Black Elk trustees	0.30
03/01/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review deposition transcript of deposition of Bart Schwartz taken in the Black Elk action to designate sections as confidential and reviewed confidentiality designation process (0.9); Revised Houlihan Lokey application to discuss HL role as an investment advisory, and not limit its role to valuation services (1.8).	2.70
03/02/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz and D. Burstein re preliminary injunction, receiver order, and PPVA server (0.2); confer with L. Gottlieb re Northstar and Black Elk (0.2); revise entities application materials (1.5); confer with C. Barenholtz re application revisions, Northstar, Black Elk, PPVA server, and privilege issues (0.3); correspondence re privilege preliminary injunction proposal (0.2); call with C. Barenholtz, D. Burstein, PPVA liquidators and their counsel re PPVA server issues (1.2); review proposed investments (0.5); confer with	4.70



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		D. Pohlman re receiver order (0.2); confer with C. Barenholtz and L. Castleberry re settlement funds (0.2); prepare for PPVA server call (0.2)	
03/02/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Calls with Barenholtz, Weiner and Ritterreiser re NorthStar	0.50
03/02/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Rothberg re NorthStar	0.20
03/02/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone calls and emails regarding to dos and status of various projects (.7); emails regarding ██████████ (.1); emails regarding PPVA information sharing agreement, telephone call with A. Seidner, D. Burstein, B. Parlin, S. Wood, M. Ziegler, J. Dorchak regarding same, follow-up telephone call with A. Seidner and D. Burstein regarding same (1.7); emails and/or telephone calls with N. Jacobson, K. McGrath, D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, A. Levine and A. Seidner regarding preliminary injunction language (.5); review revised papers on entities application and emails and telephone calls with A. Seidner, M. Ziegler, D. Burstein regarding same (.5); emails with D. Burstein, SEC regarding life insurance policies and review spreadsheets regarding same (.4); telephone calls and emails with L. Gottlieb, A. Seidner, D. Burstein regarding Northstar (.1); work on R. Ritterreiser declaration (.9); meeting with L. Castleberry and D. Pohlman regarding QSF and telephone calls and/or emails with L. Castleberry, D. Pohlman, D. Burstein and T. Rogers regarding same (.4)	6.60
03/02/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Researched equitable tolling of claims in connection to statute of limitations applicable to claims brought by the Receiver (0.7); revise declaration of Robert Ritterreiser in support of Houlihan Lokey retention application to include more detail his experience in retaining other investment advisory firms (0.3); Meeting with L. Castleberry and C. Barenholtz to discuss tax issues related to the Receivership (0.6); sent summary of materials relevant to tax issues to L. Castleberry, including an	3.10



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		explanation of organization charts (1.5).	
03/03/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz, L. Gottlieb, and R. Winning re Northstar (0.5); review Northstar application and correspondence (0.9); revise entities application materials (0.3); correspondence re PPVA server (0.2); review confidentiality designations in Black Elk deposition transcript (1.0)	2.90
03/03/17	Michael Aaron Klein	Attention to NS DIP papers and Shulse objection	0.40
03/03/17	Michael Aaron Klein	Review credit agreement for NS (1.1) and office conference with L. Gottlieb (.3)	1.40
03/03/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Confer with Celia Barenholtz re NorthStar	0.40
03/03/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Calls with Weiner re proposed Allocation of Proceeds Agreement between New Mountain Finance Corporation and PPCO in connection to the proposed Northstar DIP and review same	0.50
03/03/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Confer with Winning re letter to court on NorthStar	0.30
03/03/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re Shulse and calls with Celia Barenholtz re same	0.30
03/03/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with B. Schwartz, SEC regarding preliminary injunction and draft memo regarding privileged information (.6); emails regarding PPVA information sharing agreement and meeting regarding same (.1), emails regarding life insurance assets (.2); review ██████████ powerpoint and telephone call with ██████████ regarding same (.8); emails regarding QSF (.1); meeting D. Pohlman and email R. Rittereiser regarding R. Rittereiser declaration (.9); revise revised Houlihan Lokey agreement and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same (1.0); numerous meetings and telephone calls and emails with A. Seidner, D. Burstein, L. Gottlieb regarding Northstar (2.0); emails with B. Schwartz regarding entities application and M. Nordlicht consent (.3).	12.30



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/03/17	Robert B. Winning	Analysis of Northstar DIP issues; analysis of Shultze objection to motion to proceed with Northstar DIP	1.80
03/03/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Call with G. Duch to discuss fees incurred by law firms who provide representation to Platinum subsidiaries and status of their ongoing work (0.3); research into status of ongoing representations, including work done in ██████████ by Bryan Cave, work done by ██████████ in connection with CBOE lawsuit, and work done by Maslon LLP in Minnesota in connection with the ██████████ (0.4); reviewed spreadsheet containing life settlement portfolio information in preparation for discussion with J. Winer regarding Platinum practices updating the information and accuracy of life expectancy information (0.3); discussed declaration of R. Rittereiser in support of Houlihan Lokey application with C. Barenholtz (0.4); revise declaration of R. Rittereiser based on new details regarding past work with investment advisory firms (1.1); discuss Maslon LLP retention and contemplated secured interest taken by Maslon with S. Salfati, and reviewed documents related thereto (0.4); call with L. Castleberry, D. Burstein, and T. Rogers regarding creation of taxable settlement fund and other tax issues impacting the receivership (1.0); discuss next steps in tax work with L. Castleberry (0.1); call J. Winer regarding life settlement portfolio (0.1).	7.10
03/04/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails B. Schwartz, A. Levine, D. Burstein, A. Seidner, D. Pohlman re court docket and other matters	0.10
03/05/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Correspondence re Northstar (0.1)	0.10
03/05/17	Robert B. Winning	Draft insert to letter re: Northstar DIP motion and related research	2.80
03/05/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise declaration of R. Rittereiser in support of the Houlihan Lokey application to address work done by Rittereiser in connection to the	1.00



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Ariel and Gabriel funds and Freedom Group (1.0).	
03/06/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Draft Northstar expediting application (0.7); confer with C. Barenholtz re Northstar and entities (0.3); call with PPVA liquidators re server issues (1.0); correspondence re entities, PPVA server issues, and indemnification (0.6)	2.60
03/06/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re NorthStar matter	0.50
03/06/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review letter to court re need for prompt action and comment	0.20
03/06/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review revised R. Rittreiser declaration and meeting with D. Pohlman regarding same (.5); review Houlihan Lokey revisions to retainer letter (.4); call with M. Ziegler, S. Wood, B. Parlin, M. MacInnis, A. Seidner, D. Burstein, S. Theron, J. Goodchild, J. Dorchak regarding PPVA information sharing (1.0); email and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding proposed transactions (.5); telephone call with M. Ziegler, telephone call with D. Burstein and emails with D. Koffmann, A. Seidner, D. Burstein, N. Jacobson regarding entities application and consent (.7); read indemnification letters from Quinn, draft response and emails regarding same (.3).	3.40
03/06/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Further revise declaration of Robert Rittreiser in support of Houlihan Lokey application (1.4); call with J. Winer to discuss life settlement portfolio (0.5).	1.90
03/07/17	Alan Levine	Conference with Bart Schwartz about indemnification and entity issues	0.70
03/07/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Call with D. Koffmann, W. Burck, C. Barenholtz, and D. Burstein re entities and indemnification (0.2); review draft letters and memo re indemnification (1.3); review deposition confidentiality designations (0.8); review PPVA liquidator proposal re server issues (0.7); review correspondence re entities, PPVA server issues, and	3.60



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		indemnification (0.6)	
03/07/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call regarding consent for entities motion and emails with B. Schwartz regarding same (.1), review and revise indemnification reply and emails with A. Mooney, D. Pohlman regarding same (.8); email regarding PPVA information sharing and meeting with A. Levine regarding same (.3); status meeting with B. Schwartz, A. Levine and L. Gottlieb (in part) (1.1); emails regarding assets and SEC meeting (1.2); telephone call with P. Collins (.1).	3.60
03/07/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Seider re Northstar	0.20
03/08/17	Michael Aaron Klein	Further review of DIP credit agreement	0.40
03/08/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Correspondence with C. Barenholtz re entities application	0.20
03/08/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Meeting with A. Levine regarding D&O/indemnification and emails with D. Pohlman regarding same (.4); emails regarding SEC meeting (.2); emails with B. Schwartz, M. Ziegler, A. Seidner regarding entities motion and consent (.5); revise and circulate privilege memo (.1).	1.20
03/09/17	Alan Levine	Conference with Bart Schwartz about SEC meeting	0.20
03/09/17	Alan Levine	Analysis of server issues with PPVA; reading their proposal and cases	1.00
03/09/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with B. Schwartz, R. Rittereiser, L. Gottlieb, A. Levine and meeting with L. Gottlieb regarding Northstar; emails regarding SEC meeting.	0.50
03/09/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Meeting with Celia Barenholtz re Northstar and order authorizing DIP	0.40
03/09/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Bart and Celia re Northstar	0.30
03/09/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Discussed life settlement portfolio with J. Winer (0.1); reviewed material related to Platinum's life settlement portfolio to ensure completeness of spreadsheet tracking life	4.40



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		settlement investments (0.4); correspondence with Platinum employees regarding the [REDACTED] fee arrangement for the CBOE matter (0.4); further factual investigation into ongoing work done by law firms representing PPCO portfolio companies including work done by Dan Callahan and Stephen O'Connell in connection to the Arabella bankruptcy proceedings and connected litigation (1.1); revise application seeking the authorization to retain lawyers who represent PPCO portfolio companies to include more detailed descriptions of the work performed based on information received from Platinum and elsewhere, to add additional attorneys whose retention is contemplated, and to reflect updated figures on fees incurred by attorneys thus far (2.4).	
03/10/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with D. Pohlman re entities and indemnification (0.3); review correspondence re PPVA server proposal (0.3); correspondence with D. Koffmann, C. Barenholtz, and T. Salley re entities consents (0.9); call with C. Barenholtz and D. Burstein re entities, server issues, and LA judgment (0.8); research re entities investor issues (0.3); correspondence with M. Klett and D. Burstein re entities (0.2); confer with N. Jacobson and C. Barenholtz re Black Elk settlement (0.2); revise and circulate Black Elk settlement agreement (0.5); review B. Nash letter re U. Landesman insurance claims (0.4); review correspondence re Northstar (0.1)	4.00
03/10/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails and telephone calls with A. Seidner and N. Jacobson regarding Black Elk settlement agreement (.1), emails with B. Parlin regarding PPVA information sharing proposal, email to B. Schwartz, A. Levine regarding PPVA information sharing proposal and options and telephone call and/or emails with A. Seidner, D. Pohlman, and D. Burstein regarding same (2.3), telephone calls and/or	5.70



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		emails regarding additional receivership entities D. Koffmann, A. Seidner, D. Pohlman, M. Ziegler, A. Levine, B. Schwartz, N. Jacobson (1.0), review revised ordinary course attorneys application and telephone call with D. Pohlman regarding same (.9); emails with B. Schwartz, R. Rittereiser regarding SEC meeting and review draft powerpoint regarding same (.9), review correspondence regarding defendants' indemnity and advancement demands and emails with D. Pohlman, A. Seidner, A. Levine and A. Mooney regarding same (.3), telephone call with L. Gottlieb regarding Northstar and email A. Seidner, D. Pohlman, A. Levine regarding status (.2).	
03/10/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Bart re Northstar (.2); conference call with group re Northstar (.4); call with Weiner re results of conference call (.2); call with Mike Klett re issues on Northstar (.4); review summary of options from Klett and call with Klett re same (.5)	1.70
03/10/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Weiner re Northstar	0.50
03/10/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Celia Barenholtz re Northstar	0.20
03/10/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Discuss status of ordinary course application with C. Barenholtz (0.4); revise ordinary course professional application based on new information from counsel for Arabella (2.5).	2.90
03/11/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review documents from Bernstein (1.1); calls with Weiner and Klett re Northstar (.5); call with Bart Schwartz (.3)	1.80
03/13/17	Michael Aaron Klein	Review redline of DIP Credit Agreement and Fiscal Agency Agreement and correspond with LG re: same	2.30
03/13/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with D. Koffmann, C. Barenholtz, and T. Salley re entities consents (0.7); confer with M. Klett re entities reporting (0.1); correspondence with A. Levine re J. SanFilippo (0.1); revise entities application materials (1.4); correspondence re section 754 filings (0.4)	2.70



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/13/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call and emails with M. Klett regarding PWC (.2), emails regarding rescheduling SEC meeting (.1), meeting with M. Klett, B. Schwartz, R. Rittereiser, D. Burstein regarding SEC meeting and related matters (2.0) (local travel time omitted); meeting with R. Rittereiser regarding declaration, revisions to same and email to R. Rittereiser (.1); telephone calls and emails with A. Seidner, telephone call with N. Jacobson, email M. Ziegler regarding entities application (.7), preparation for and telephone call with A. Fan and email N. Jacobson regarding Houlihan Lokey (.4), meeting and emails with D. Pohlman regarding common interest research and status of projects (.3).	3.80
03/13/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review items for DIP loan (.5); emails re DIP loan (.3)	0.80
03/14/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise application to retain tax professionals in order to file tax return extensions (0.8).	0.80
03/15/17	Alan Levine	Conference with Celia Barenholtz on PPVA and [REDACTED] issues	0.50
03/15/17	Alan Levine	Review PCM issues with Mark Nordlicht	0.40
03/15/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re Northstar, entities, and section 754 filings (0.3); confer with D. Pohlman re D&O letter (0.1); correspondence with M. Klett re entities reporting (0.2); correspondence with A. Levine and K. O'Brien re J. SanFilippo (0.2); review correspondence from M. Nordlicht counsel re entities and commingling issues (0.6); correspondence with N. Jacobson, D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, C. Barenholtz, H. Gonzalez, and S. Horowitz re section 754 filings (1.2)	2.60
03/15/17	Michael Aaron Klein	Review agreement for credit bidding terms	0.60
03/15/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Daileader re Northstar	0.30
03/15/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Email re Northstar	0.20
03/15/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Calls with Z. Weiner, R. Rittereiser, and M.	0.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Klett re Northstar.	
03/15/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Bernstein, Harris, Weiner, Ritterreiser, etc.	0.60
03/15/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Do an analysis and email re rights of Note Holders under Fiscal Agency Agreement in connection to Northstar vote on DIP filing	0.80
03/15/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Meeting with A. Levine regarding PPVA and [REDACTED] issues (.5); emails with B. Schwartz, A. Seidner, D. Burstein regarding filing requirement (.2); revise PWC application and email M. Klett regarding same (1.0), correspondence with D. Koffmann and telephone calls and emails with A. Seidner, B. Schwartz, A. Levine and D. Burstein regarding entities application issues (.5); meeting with L. Gottlieb and numerous emails with L. Gottlieb, Z. Weiner, R. Ritterreiser, A. Levine and D. Burstein regarding Northstar (.6); correspondence with D. Koffmann and emails with A. Mooney, A. Levine regarding D&O questions and related matters (.2); revise ordinary course application, assess issues relating to Platinum litigation and use of counsel, meetings with D. Pohlman regarding same (3.0), review draft claim form and meeting with D. Pohlman regarding same (.5).	6.50
03/15/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails with Levine and Barenholtz re Northstar developments	0.30
03/15/17	Robert B. Winning	Meeting with Gottlieb re: Northstar DIP	0.70
03/15/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Call with G. Duch to discuss updates to amounts billed by PPCO portfolio company attorneys, and receipt of invoices from those attorneys(0.2); revise application seeking authorization to retain tax professionals based on feedback from C. Barenholtz (0.7).	0.90
03/16/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with D. Pohlman re information sharing stipulation (0.1); correspondence with C. Barenholtz re information sharing stipulation (0.1); revise information sharing stipulation (1.0)	1.20



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
 CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/16/17	Michael Aaron Klein	Further review of fiscal agency agreement	0.80
03/16/17	Michael Aaron Klein	Review DIP term sheet	0.20
03/16/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call and emails with B. Schwartz, D. Pohlman, N. Jacobson, D. Burstein and A. Fan regarding Houlihan Lokey issues (.2); telephone call with L. Gottlieb and numerous emails with B. Schwartz, L. Gottlieb, Z. Weiner, R. Rittereiser regarding Northstar and meeting with A. Levine regarding same (.3); telephone call with B. Schwartz and H. Werblowsky regarding PPVA and PMNY issues and meeting with A. Levine regarding same (.3), emails and/or meetings with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, A. Seidner, D. Pohlman regarding PPVA information sharing, read D. Pohlman memo on common interest and cases regarding same, draft outline for information sharing stipulation (1.4); attention to miscellaneous case administration matters (.3).	2.50
03/16/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re Northstar default	0.40
03/16/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Rittereiser re Northstar	0.30
03/16/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review proposal prepared by Zach and emails re same	0.50
03/16/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Bart, Klett and Rittereiser re Northstar	0.40
03/16/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise retention agreement between Houlihan Lokey and Guidepost (0.2); revise ordinary course professional application based on feedback from C. Barenholtz, clarifying description of the work being performed by the professionals (6.2); revised investor claim form (0.7) prepared draft stipulation between PPCO and PPVA regarding an information sharing agreement (2.2).	9.30
03/17/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re information sharing stipulation, monthly reporting, entities application, and Northstar (0.4); revise entities application (0.2); confer with M. Klett re	1.90



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		monthly reporting (0.2); call with D. Burstein and C. Barenholtz re entities, reporting, Northstar, and server issues (0.6); revise information sharing stipulation (0.2); review Black Elk settlement revisions (0.2); confer with D. Pohlman re Black Elk (0.1)	
03/17/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review draft stipulation regarding information sharing (.4); review, analyze, comment on and revise ordinary course application and related issues concerning Platinum litigation and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same (2.2); meeting with A. Levine and B. Schwartz regarding entities application, Northstar, affirmative litigation and related matters (1.2); emails with D. Burstein, R. Rittereiser, B. Schwartz, M. Klett, N. Jacobson, and D. Pohlman regarding Rittereiser declaration and Houlihan Lokey application (.2); emails with B. Schwartz regarding litigation funding and employment issues (.3); telephone calls with A. Seidner, N. Jacobson, D. Koffmann, and D. Burstein regarding orphan entities and related matters and emails with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, D. Burstein and A. Seidner regarding same and to do (1.7).	6.00
03/17/17	Robert B. Winning	Meeting with Gottlieb re: Northstar issue	0.40
03/17/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Further legal research regarding potential information sharing agreement, reviewing legal precedent provided by PPVA (2.4); correspondence with G. Duch regarding updated information from ordinary course professionals, updated descriptions of work performed, and new fee information (0.5); revise application seeking the retention of attorneys performing work for PPCO portfolio companies based on feedback from C. Barenholtz, and to incorporate new details on ongoing work performed in connection with Receivership Property outside the U.S. (3.5).	6.40
03/17/17	Alan Levine	Meeting with CGB and Bart Schwartz re entities application (1.2)	1.20



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/20/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review, comment on, and revise ordinary course application, attention to issues relating to Platinum counsel and litigation, and emails with D. Pohlman and D. Burstein regarding same (2.5); prepare for SEC meeting with B. Schwartz, M. Klett, R. Rittereiser and D. Burstein (1.3) (local travel time omitted); meeting with B. Schwartz, R. Rittereiser, D. Burstein, N. Jacobson, K. McGrath, A. Bambach, K. Byrne and A. Grace (2.3) (local travel time omitted), telephone calls and emails with N. Jacobson regarding Houlihan Lokey application (.1); telephone calls and emails with D. Koffmann, A. Seidner regarding entities application and related issues (.3).	6.50
03/20/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re entities application and SEC meeting (0.1); revise entities application materials (2.1); correspondence with C. Barenholtz, D. Koffmann, M. Klett, and T. Rogers re monthly reporting and accounting (1.2)	3.40
03/20/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re Northstar	0.30
03/20/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise ordinary course professional application (0.9); revise Houlihan Lokey application based on finalized version of R. Rittereiser declaration (4.5).	5.40
03/21/17	Alan Levine	Review [REDACTED] proposal and call counsel	0.50
03/21/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails regarding small judgment (.1), emails with A. Levine, A. Seidner, D. Pohlman regarding SEC meeting (.2), emails with N. Jacobson and D. Pohlman regarding PWC application (.2), revise Houlihan Lokey letter application and emails with D. Pohlman and R. Rittereiser regarding same (.5); revise entities letter application and emails with A. Seidner regarding same, related matters, telephone call with M. Ziegler regarding same, email and telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding 2nd amended receiver order (3.1); review and revise Black Elk settlement agreement (.8); telephone call with S.	6.60



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Horowitz, G. Duch, P. Poteat, D. Burstein regarding information sharing arrangement issues (1.1); telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding [REDACTED] diligence, emails and/or telephone calls regarding same with B. Schwartz, D. Burstein, M. Klett, R. Rittereiser, A. Levine (.6).	
03/21/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re entities application (0.1); revise entities application materials (3.0); confer with D. Pohlman re consent issues (0.1)	3.20
03/21/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review Settlement Agreement changes	0.20
03/21/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revised and finalized application to retain tax professionals (0.4); sought consents from individual defendants to the tax professional retention application (2.2); revised and finalized version of Houlihan Lokey retention application to send to S.E.C. (1.4).	4.00
03/22/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone calls and/or emails with N. Jacobson, D. Burstein, A. Seidner, D. Koffmann regarding entities application and related issues (1.0); emails with D. Pohlman regarding PWC application (1.0); emails with J. Waggoner and N. Jacobson regarding Black Elk settlement agreement (.2); telephone calls and emails with D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, A. Levine regarding [REDACTED] retainer (.5); telephone calls and/or emails with D. Pohlman, R. Rittereiser, D. Burstein, D. Koffmann regarding Houlihan Lokey application and review final edits to same (.5); continue to revise PPVA information sharing stipulation and emails regarding same with D. Burstein, A. Seidner, D. Pohlman, A. Levine and B. Parlin (1.8); telephone calls with A. Levine and B. Schwartz regarding [REDACTED] call M. Klett, R. Rittereiser, A. Levine, B. Schwartz, D. Burstein regarding [REDACTED] and draft; email regarding questions from SEC meeting (1.8); emails and/or telephone calls with D. Koffmann, D. Burstein, B. Schwartz	7.80



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		regarding Marbridge (.1); call with D. Pohlman, D. Burstein, G. Duch, S. Horowitz, Z. Weiner, H. Werblowsky, D. Steinberg, and S. Salfati about ordinary course retention application factual issues and related matters and follow up emails regarding same (.9).	
03/22/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz, N. Jacobson, and D. Burstein re entities application (0.6); revise entities application materials (2.2); confer with D. Pohlman re consent issues (0.2); correspondence with defendants' counsel re entities application consents (1.8); review materials from SEC meeting (0.6); review Black Elk settlement revisions (0.2); revise information-sharing stipulation (0.5)	6.10
03/22/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Call to discuss ordinary application seeking the retention of counsel for PPCO portfolio companies with C. Barenholtz, D. Burstein, G. Duch, S. Horowitz, Z. Weiner, H. Werblowsky, D. Steinberg, S. Salfati and follow up emails regarding same (0.9); revise application seeking the retention of counsel for PPCO portfolio companies based on group call and new information received from Platinum portfolio managers (1.4); review draft information sharing agreement between PPCO and PPVA (1.0).	3.60
03/23/17	Alan Levine	Confer with Bart Schwartz about Investor letter	0.30
03/23/17	Alan Levine	Review and propose changes to access to documents stipulation	0.30
03/23/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone call with J. Waggoner regarding Black Elk, telephone call with A. Seidner regarding same (.3); emails with S. Horowitz, D. Burstein and P. Poteat regarding information sharing agreement and related IT matters (.9); telephone call with H. Werblowsky, D. Burstein, D. Pohlman regarding Platinum counsel relationships (.5); telephone call with L. Gottlieb regarding counsel in bankruptcy cases, Northstar and Black Elk (.2); telephone calls and emails with	2.70



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		B. Schwartz, A. Levine, D. Burstein, A. Seidner, D. Pohlman regarding investor letter (.7); telephone call and emails with A. Seidner regarding entities application (.1).	
03/23/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Finalize and file entities application (2.5); confer with D. Pohlman and H. Gonzalez re applications (0.2); review Black Elk settlement revisions (0.2); research Black Elk financial tracing (2.3); review correspondence with Guidepost (0.4); confer with C. Barenholtz re Black Elk and letter applications (0.3)	5.90
03/23/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with C. Barenholtz re Northstar and other Platinum matters	0.30
03/23/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review emails and agreement re new deal with Arapa	0.60
03/23/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Call with H. Werblowksy, D. Burstein, C. Barenholtz regarding ordinary course professional application (0.6); discuss action items regarding ordinary course professional application with G. Duch (0.1); review and revise ordinary course professional application (1.2).	1.90
03/24/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails regarding investor letter and telephone call with A. Levine regarding same (.3); revise information sharing stipulation and telephone calls and/or emails regarding same with D. Burstein. A. Levine, A. Seidner (1.1); telephone call with B. Schwartz. M. Klett, R. Rittereiser, E. Bertram, T. Cohen, D. Burstein regarding ██████████ and other portfolio diligence (.6); emails with D. Burstein, L. Gottlieb, B. Schwartz regarding potential ██████████ escrow arrangement (.3); telephone call with L. Gottlieb regarding Northstar (.1); review and revise Black Elk settlement agreement, emails and/or telephone calls regarding same and related matters with N. Jacobson. D. Burstein, J. Waggoner, A. Seidner (1.0); emails with N. Jacobson, D. Burstein, A. Levine, B. Schwartz regarding PPVA onshore receiver, telephone calls with T. Salley and D. Burstein regarding	4.20



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		same (.8).	
03/24/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz and D. Burstein re Black Elk transfers	0.20
03/24/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Call with Rothberg, Rittereiser, etc.	1.10
03/24/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise ordinary course professional application based on updated information received from G. Duch (2.3); research into counsel for life settlement policy work, retention agreement for life settlement policy work, and other related issues (1.1); correspondence with H. Werblowsky regarding work performed by Ganfer & Shore (0.4).	3.80
03/27/17	Alan Levine	Call with [REDACTED], attorney for [REDACTED], secured lender	0.20
03/27/17	Alan Levine	Call with Dan Burstein and Celia Barenholtz reviewing terms of document access by PPVA	0.60
03/27/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Confer with C. Barenholtz re Black Elk settlement; review settlement drafts	0.40
03/27/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review email from Cayman Liquidator regarding information sharing, emails with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, D. Burstein regarding same, prepare for call regarding same, telephone call with A. Levine, D. Burstein regarding same and PPVA onshore (1.2); emails with D. Burstein, A. Levine regarding [REDACTED] and related issues (.1); review and revise creditors form and telephone call and/or email T. Cohen and D. Burstein regarding same (.3).	1.60
03/27/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Correspond with J. Winer regarding legal professionals used in connection to life settlement portfolio (0.3); reviewed supporting documentation sent by G. Duch from legal professionals to be retained under the ordinary course professional application (4.5); research into work performed in connection to Arabella bankruptcy and related matters (1.2); research into fees incurred by Curtis Mallet-Prevost in connection to [REDACTED] arbitration (1.0).	7.00



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
 CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/27/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re: Arena DIP loan and review of related documents	0.90
03/28/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Review Black Elk settlement draft revisions (0.4); review defendant correspondence re receiver applications (0.3); confer with D. Burstein, D. Pohlman, and H. Gonzalez re filings (0.3); review correspondence re PPVA receivership issues (0.1)	1.10
03/28/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Telephone calls and emails with D. Burstein, J. Waggoner, N. Jacobson regarding Black Elk agreement and edits to same (.9); telephone calls and/or emails with M. Ziegler, D. Burstein, B. Schwartz regarding information sharing stipulation (.4); emails regarding miscellaneous matters (SEC regarding documents, forensic meeting and review docket) (.4); emails and telephone call with W. Schwartz, B. Schwartz, M. Baum regarding Arabella settlement (.5); telephone call with N. Jacobson regarding PPVA onshore and emails with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, D. Burstein regarding same (.2); emails with P. Collins, B. Schwartz and D. Burstein regarding [REDACTED] (.1).	2.50
03/28/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review documents re developments in Northstar	0.40
03/28/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise ordinary course professional application based on factual research, updating case descriptions with information received directly from attorneys or taken from case dockets (7.5); correspondence with G. Duch regarding potential interplay between entities application and D&O policy proceeds (0.3);	7.80
03/29/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Review defendant correspondence re receiver applications (0.4); correspondence with D. Burstein and C. Barenholtz re 28 USC 754 filings and response to receiver entities objections (0.8)	1.20
03/29/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with B. Schwartz, A. Levine, D. Burstein regarding investor letter (.1), email D.	4.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		Burstein regarding ██████████ analysis (.1), emails with B. Schwartz, M. Baum, D. Pohlman regarding Arabella settlement (.3); review court filings and telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same (.1), emails with P. Poteat, S. Horowitz, D. Burstein regarding information sharing stipulation, telephone call with B. Schwartz regarding same (.5), review, revise and comment on liquidation plan memo and read parts of cited cases (3.0), email regarding ██████████ and telephone call and/or email with D. Burstein regarding ordinary course application (.3), review R. Rittereiser email regarding ██████████ (.1).	
03/29/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Emails re issues for Northstar, DIP loan and 363 sale	0.80
03/29/17	Lawrence C. Gottlieb	Review emergency motion on exclusivity	0.30
03/29/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise ordinary course professional application based on feedback from C. Barenholtz (0.4); reviewed invoices submitted by Curtis Mallet-Prevost in connection to ██████████ arbitration to investigate basis for ongoing fees incurred by PPCO (0.4); correspondence with H. Werblowsky regarding Curtis Mallet-Prevost work (0.3); call with J. Winer and G. Duch regarding counsel retained in connection to life settlement portfolio and correspondence regarding the same (0.7); further revised retention application for counsel representing PPCO based on direct communications from attorneys and information received from H. Werblowsky, J. Winer, and G. Duch related to counsel for life insurance matters, proposed counsel to collect on default judgment and others (2.4).	4.10
03/30/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Draft response to entities objections (4.9); confer with D. Burstein, S. Horowitz, H. Werblowsky, and C. Barenholtz re response to receiver entities objections (0.9); confer with C. Barenholtz and R. Morales re receivership website (0.3); review opposition to entities	6.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		application (0.4)	
03/30/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Review, revise, comment on and meetings with D. Pohlman regarding ordinary course application and related issues (1.5), telephone calls and emails with A. Levine, D. Burstein, B. Schwartz, A. Seidner, N. Jacobson, D. Koffmann regarding objections to entities application, review objections, revise letter to court regarding same (3.0), telephone call with ██████ regarding receivership procedures, telephone call with D. Burstein regarding same and updating website, telephone call with A. Seidner regarding same (.8), meetings with D. Pohlman regarding Arabella approval application (.1), telephone calls and/or emails with D. Burstein, P. Poteat regarding information sharing agreement, PPVA onshore and related matters (.2).	5.60
03/30/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Discussed Arabella settlement agreement with M. Baum and J. Grekin of Schafer & Weiner, discussed Schafer & Weiner's request to take a secured interest in Arabella as part of its retention agreement (1.3); correspondence and research regarding same (1.0); revised ordinary course professional application to remove attorneys who have provided work in connection with the Arabella matters as they will be part of the settlement approval application (0.4); revised application seeking retention of attorneys in the ordinary course to address comments from C. Barenholtz (3.5); correspondence with S. Salfati regarding Maslon's work for the receivership in connection to ordinary course professional application revisions (0.1).	6.20
03/31/17	Abigail Belknap Seidner	Finalize and file response to entities objections (1.4); confer with D. Burstein, C. Barenholtz, A. Levine, B. Schwartz, N. Jacobson, and K. McGrath re response to receiver entities objections (0.7); confer with R. Morales re receivership website (0.2); confer with S. Horowitz, D. Pohlman, K.	3.50



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
		McGrath, N. Jacobson, and T. Rogers re 28 U.S.C. 754 filings (1.2)	
03/31/17	Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	Emails with A. Seidner, K. Byrne, A. Levine regarding letter to court regarding PMNY, final edits to same (.2), emails and/or telephone calls with R. Rittereiser, D. Steinberg, B. Schwartz, R. Winning, D. Pohlman, and A. Levine regarding [REDACTED] loan and interest and default interest on secured debt and read cases regarding same (1.3), emails with A. Seidner, D. Pohlman, D. Burstein regarding property notices, ordinary course application (.1).	1.60
03/31/17	Robert B. Winning	Research re: payment of post-petition interest in chapter 11 and call with C. Barenholtz re: same	0.40
03/31/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Discussed Maslon retention agreement with S. Salfati (0.5); review documents related to Maslon's proposed security interest in the [REDACTED] (1.2); discussed Malson's work for the Receivership with B. Mower (0.3); prepared summary of Maslon's proposed contingency arrangement (0.3); revised ordinary course professional application based on new Maslon information (1.3).	3.30
Task Total:			292.50 251,106.00

EMPLOYEE BENEFITS/PENSIONS

02/24/17	David A. Walsh	Review proposed Platinum employee retention bonus arrangement and respond to C. Barenholtz regarding tax and related considerations.	0.50
03/17/17	Elizabeth L. Lewis	Email correspondence with B. Schwartz re: employment matter; follow up with M. Shreiner re: same	0.60
03/18/17	Elizabeth L. Lewis	Email correspondence with B. Schwartz and M. Shreiner re: transition plan for General Counsel; analyze issues re: same	0.60



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
 CL 01 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
03/19/17	Marybeth W. Shreiner	Email correspondence with B. Schwartz re transition agreement	0.20	
03/20/17	Marybeth W. Shreiner	Telephone conference with B. Schwartz re transition agreement; begin drafting transition agreement	1.00	
03/21/17	Marybeth W. Shreiner	Draft transition agreement (1.0); email correspondence with B. Schwartz re same (.1)	1.10	
03/22/17	Marybeth W. Shreiner	Email correspondence with B. Schwartz re separation agreement	0.20	
Task Total:			4.20	3,241.00

TAX ISSUES

03/02/17	William L. Castleberry	Prepare for meeting and meet with C. Barenholtz and D. Pohlman (.8); review order and organization charts (1.1); prepare for call Friday (2.4)	4.30	
03/03/17	William L. Castleberry	Prepare for call and phone conference T. Rogers (Platinum) and D. Pohlman (2.6); email to C. Barenholtz and D. Pohlman (.8)	3.40	
Task Total:			7.70	10,241.00

Total Fees **\$265,583.00**

Reduction requested by the SEC Staff in connection to work performed by Daniel Pohlman on issues relating to the review of Platinum's ongoing legal work (4,200.00)
 15% Discount (39,207.45)

Subtotal Fees **\$222,175.55**



330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
David A. Walsh	975	.50	487.50
Thomas R. Salley	995	1.00	995.00
Elizabeth L. Lewis	1055	1.20	1,266.00
Alan Levine	1375	6.70	9,212.50
Celia Goldwag Barenholtz	1175	100.10	117,617.50
William L. Castleberry	1330	7.70	10,241.00
Lawrence C. Gottlieb	1185	20.30	24,055.50
Michael Aaron Klein	850	6.10	5,185.00
Marybeth W. Shreiner	595	2.50	1,487.50
Robert B. Winning	835	6.10	5,093.50
Abigail Belknap Seidner	670	65.60	43,952.00
Daniel J. Pohlman	525	87.60	45,990.00

For costs and disbursements recorded through March 31, 2017 :

Federal Express	13.40
Reproduction of Documents	86.25
Research Database / Document Retrieval	4,659.24
Total Costs	\$4,758.89
Total:	\$226,934.44



May 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

330014-201
Receiver of Platinum Partners funds

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1755134
CL 01 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 3/31/2017-Invoice No. 1755134:		
Fees	\$	222,175.55
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	4,758.89
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	226,934.44

Cooley LLP
101 California Street, 5th floor
San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:
Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S
**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may
accrue late charges.



April 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1743487
TX 03 60031

330014-202



For services rendered through March 31, 2017

Fees	\$	1,421.20
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	197.72
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	1,618.92



330014-202
 [REDACTED]

Invoice Number: 1743487
 TX 03 60031

For services rendered through March 31, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	
CASE ADMINISTRATION				
03/02/17	Lynn D. Horwitz	Attention to [REDACTED] documents and emails in preparation for call with PPVA (1.9)	1.90	
		Task Total:	1.90	1,672.00

Total Fees	\$1,672.00
15% Discount	(250.80)
Subtotal Fees	\$1,421.20

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Lynn D. Horwitz	880	1.90	1,672.00

For costs and disbursements recorded through March 31, 2017 :

Research Database / Document Retrieval	197.72
Total Costs	\$197.72
Total:	\$1,618.92



April 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
 Management & Related Entities
 Guidepost Solutions LLC
 415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
 New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
 5th floor
 San Francisco, CA
 94111-5800
 MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
 94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
 San Diego, CA
 Los Angeles, CA
 Broomfield, CO
 Seattle, WA
 New York, NY
 Reston, VA
 Washington, DC
 Boston, MA
 Shanghai, P. R. China
 London, United Kingdom

330014-202



Invoice Number: 1743487
 TX 03 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 3/31/2017-Invoice No. 1743487:		
Fees	\$	1,421.20
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	197.72
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	1,618.92

Outstanding Balance from prior Invoices as of 4/12/2017 *(May not reflect recent payments)*

<u>Invoice Number</u>	<u>Invoice Date</u>	<u>Balance</u>	<u>Late Charges</u>	<u>Balance Due</u>
1726576	2/23/2017	43,842.15	0.00	43,842.15
1732303	3/07/2017	9,995.15	0.00	9,995.15
Total Outstanding Balance from prior Invoices (Disregard if paid)				\$ 53,837.30
Total Amount Due on Current and Prior Invoices.....				\$ 55,456.22



330014-202
[REDACTED]

Invoice Number: 1743487
TX 03 60031

Cooley LLP
101 California Street, 5th floor
San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:
Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S
**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may accrue late charges.



April 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
Management & Related Entities
Guidepost Solutions LLC
415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
New York, NY 10017

ATTORNEYS AT LAW

101 California
5th floor
San Francisco, CA
94111-5800
MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com

Taxpayer ID Number
94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
San Diego, CA
Los Angeles, CA
Broomfield, CO
Seattle, WA
New York, NY
Reston, VA
Washington, DC
Boston, MA
Shanghai, P. R. China
London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1743488
CC 02 60031

330014-203
D&O Issues

For services rendered through March 31, 2017

Fees	\$	24,652.12
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	348.97
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	25,001.09



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1743488
CC 02 60031

For services rendered through March 31, 2017 :

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
CASE ADMINISTRATION			
03/01/17	Alan Levine	Call with counsel for San Fillipo (0.5) and with counsel for Mann (0.8) re indemnification	1.30
03/02/17	Alan Levine	Calls with counsel and Platinum people (Harvey Werblowsky) on indemnification issues	2.50
03/03/17	Alan Levine	Call with Susan Horowitz and Harvey Werblowsky and Ann Mooney dealing with issues on D&O policy, document demand	1.20
03/03/17	Ann M. Mooney	Prepare for and participate in conference call with H. Werblowsky, S. Horowitz and A. Levine re D&O insurance status and issues	1.50
03/04/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review indemnification provisions in Platinum organizational documents and respond to demand from Mark Nordlicht requesting advancement and indemnification (4.5).	4.50
03/06/17	Ann M. Mooney	Review and revise draft letter to Nordlicht's counsel in response to indemnification demand	0.60
03/06/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review indemnification provisions in PPCO, PPLO, and subsidiary documents, and the reviewed which entity controlled advancement obligations under the documents (3.5); revise letter responding to Nordlicht demand for advancement and indemnification (2.1).	5.60
03/07/17	Ann M. Mooney	Telephone conversation with S. Horowitz re communications with excess carriers re information requests (.10); review draft letter re response to indemnification demand (.20)	0.30
03/07/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise letter to Nordlicht based on comments from A. Mooney, A. Levine, and C. Barenholtz, (0.9); revise memorandum summarizing D&O insurance issues based on feedback from A. Mooney, so as to better reflect the priority provisions in the operative insurance policies (1.8).	2.70



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1743488
CC 02 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/08/17	Alan Levine	Review and revise letter response to indemnification demand (0.8); read cases involving D&O/indemnification to Fashion Receiver position (1.0); call with counsel (0.7)	2.50
03/09/17	Alan Levine	Review additional indemnification letters from other defendants and instructions for Reply	0.50
03/10/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Review and revise letter to Nordlicht regarding indemnification (0.4); review indemnification demand from Mann (0.4); prepare response to Mann indemnification demand (0.4); further review of indemnification provisions, reviewing provisions cited in Mann letter, and [REDACTED] (4.2).	5.40
03/14/17	Ann M. Mooney	Telephone conversation with M. Coogan (Steinberg's's counsel) re status of insurance issues	0.30
03/14/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Correspondence regarding response to Mann indemnification demand.	0.20
03/15/17	Alan Levine	Indemnification letter to Morvillo (0.2); new indemnification issues on current employees (0.2)	0.40
03/15/17	Ann M. Mooney	Telephone conversation with S. Horowitz re D&O insurance issues and status	0.80
03/15/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise letter to M. Mann regarding indemnification demand (0.4); review response from Nordlicht regarding indemnification demand (0.2).	0.60
03/16/17	Ann M. Mooney	Review indemnification memorandum and e-mail to team re same	0.30
03/16/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Revise and finalize memorandum summarizing advancement and indemnification issues.	0.90
03/17/17	Ann M. Mooney	Telephone conversation with A. Levine re D&O insurance issues	0.10
03/17/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Prepare letter to Bailey Cavalieri regarding providing requested information related to D&O policy.	0.70



**330014-203
D&O Issues**

Invoice Number: 1743488
CC 02 60031

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>
03/23/17	Alan Levine	Review new indemnification letters from Landesman, Levy	0.60
03/23/17	Ann M. Mooney	Conference call with Platinum internal team and primary carrier counsel re status of payment and insurance issues	0.50
03/24/17	Ann M. Mooney	Telephone conversation with A. Levine re D&O insurance issues	0.10
03/24/17	Daniel J. Pohlman	Prepared response letter to indemnification demand from Uri Landesman (2.8).	2.80
Task Total:			36.90
			29,002.50

Total Fees **\$29,002.50**

15% Discount (4,350.38)

Subtotal Fees **\$24,652.12**

Fee Summary:

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Total</u>
Ann M. Mooney	965	4.50	4,342.50
Alan Levine	1375	9.00	12,375.00
Daniel J. Pohlman	525	23.40	12,285.00

For costs and disbursements recorded through March 31, 2017 :

Reproduction of Documents 4.05

Research Database / Document Retrieval 344.92

Total Costs **\$348.97**

Total: **\$25,001.09**



April 12, 2017

Bart M. Schwartz, As Receiver of Platinum Partners
 Management & Related Entities
 Guidepost Solutions LLC
 415 Madison Avenue, 17th Floor
 New York, NY 10017

330014-203
D&O Issues

ATTORNEYS AT LAW
 101 California
 5th floor
 San Francisco, CA
 94111-5800
 MAIN 415 693-2000

www.cooley.com
 Taxpayer ID Number
 94-1140085

Palo Alto, CA
 San Diego, CA
 Los Angeles, CA
 Broomfield, CO
 Seattle, WA
 New York, NY
 Reston, VA
 Washington, DC
 Boston, MA
 Shanghai, P. R. China
 London, United Kingdom

Invoice Number: 1743488
 CC 02 60031

REMITTANCE ADVICE

Please include this Remittance Advice with your payment

For current services rendered through 3/31/2017-Invoice No. 1743488:		
Fees	\$	24,652.12
Chargeable costs and disbursements	\$	348.97
Total Due on Current Invoice	\$	25,001.09

Outstanding Balance from prior Invoices as of 4/12/2017 *(May not reflect recent payments)*

<u>Invoice Number</u>	<u>Invoice Date</u>	<u>Balance</u>	<u>Late Charges</u>	<u>Balance Due</u>
1726577	2/23/2017	8,559.92	0.00	8,559.92
1739900	3/30/2017	36,948.32	0.00	36,948.32
Total Outstanding Balance from prior Invoices (Disregard if paid)			\$	45,508.24
Total Amount Due on Current and Prior Invoices.....			\$	70,509.33



330014-203
D&O Issues

Invoice Number: 1743488
CC 02 60031

Cooley LLP
101 California Street, 5th floor
San Francisco, CA 94111-5800

Tax ID# 94-1140085

Payment may be made by wire transfer or ACH:
Wells Fargo Bank - San Francisco, CA 94104
Account # 4129155206 ABA Routing # 121000248 Swift # WFBIUS6S
**When making electronic payments please provide invoice number(s)
and send remittance advice to AR@cooley.com**

Invoices are due and payable upon receipt. Any unpaid balance after 30 days may accrue late charges.